City of Fairhope Bid Tabulation

Bid No. 23-008 Fire Extinguisher Inspection Services

Opened November 18, 2022 at 10:00 A.M.

R. Carter & R. Carter &
Fire and Safety Fire and Safety lates, Inc. (RCAJA fates, Inc. (RCA Safety Safety VSC Fire & VSC Fire &
C dities, Inc. | C ditles, Inc. Inc) inc) Extinguisher LLC | Extinguisher LLC Securlty, Inc. Security, inc.
Bid Documents Signed / Notarized (Y/N) Y Y : Y
Vendor Compliance (Y/N) X Y Y Y
Addendum 1 (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
2021 Estimated
8id Forrn Items Quantities Price per Unit Extended Pricing Price per Unit Extended Pricin| Price per Unit Extanded Pricing Price per Unit Extended Pricing
/Annual inspections (Sticker Tags on all extinguishers
1 exposed to elements) 527 $3.00 $1,581.00 $5.00 $2,635.00 $7.00 $3,689.00 $4.00 $2,108.00
2 2.5# ABC, BC Recharge $5.00 $15.00 $14.00 $32.00
= 5# ABC, BC Recharge 4 $75.00 $300.00 $20.00 $80.00 $17.00 $68.00 $32.00 $128.00
4 10# ABC, BC Recharge 9 $30.00 $270.00 $25.00 $225.00 $20.00 $180.00 $35.00 $315.00
5 20# ABC, BC Recharge 2 $20.00 $40.00 $35.00 $70.00 $31.00 $62.00 $40.00 $80,00
3 2.5# Halatron Recharge $5.00 $198.00* $18.00 $204.00
7 5# Halatron Recharge $5.00 $357.00" $22.00 5340.00
8 11# Halatron Recharge $5.00 $695.00* 528.00 702.00
g 30# Class D Recharge $5.00 $285.00 532,00 $1,065.00
10 |2.5 Gallon Recharge H20 2 $5.00 $10.00 $22.00 5$44.00 15.00 $30.00 $13.00 $26.00
11 5# CO2 Recharge 6 $5.00 $30.00 $9.00 $54.00 $18.00 $108.00 $30.00 $180.00
12 |10# CO2 Recharge 4 $10.00 5$40.00 $10.00 $40.00 $22.00 $88.00 $30.00 $120.00
13 |20# CO2 Recharge 1 $10.00 $10.00 $20.00 $20.00 528.00 $28.00 $12.00 $12.00
i4 2.5# ABC, BC Six (6) Year 4 $8.00 $32.00 $25.00 $100.00 $19.00 $76.00 $12.00 548.00
15 5H ABC, BC Six (6) Year 5 $10.00 $50.00 $35.00 $175.00 §22.00 $110.00 $12.00 560.00
16 10# ABC, BC Six (6) Year 1 $12.00 $12.00 $45.00 545,00 $25.00 $25.00 $12.00 $12.00
17 |20# ABC, BC Six {6) Year 1 $40.00 $40.00 $60.00 $60.00 $36.00 $36.00 $12.00 $12.00
18 |ABC, BC Six {6) Year NOBID NOBID $6.00 $12.00
19 2.5# Halatron Six {6) Year $5.00 $198.00* $6.00 5204.00
20 5# Halatron Six (6) Year 1 $10.00 $10.00 5$357.00* $357.00 $10.00 $10.00 340.00 $340.00
21 11# Halatron Six (6) Year $5.00 $695.00* $22.00 $702.00
22 2.5# Hydro BC ABC $5.00 $35.00* $24.00 $20.00
23 5# Hydro BC ABC 4 $12.00 $48.00 $45.00* $180.00 $28.00 $112.00 $20.00 $80.00
24 10# Hydro BC ABC $15.00 $60.00 $29.00 $20.00
25 20# Hydro BC ABC $15.00 $80.00 $40.00 $20.00
26 10# Hydro CO2 $10.00 $45.00 $18.00 $20.00
27 20# Hydro CO2 e $10.00 $10.00 $45.00 $45.00 $28.00 $28.00 $369.00 $369.00
28 30# Class D Hydro $5.00 $40.00 $32.00 $1,065.00
29 2.5 Gallon Hydro H20 10 $5.00 $50.00 $25.00 $250.00 $27.00 $270.00 $142.00 $1,420.00
30 |2.5# Halatron Hydro $10.00 $198.00* $24.00 $204.00
31 S# Halatron Hydro $10.00 $357.00* $27.00 $340.00
32 11# Halatron Hydro $10.00 $695.00* $32.00 $702.00




33 New ABC, BC 2,54 13 $28.00 $364.00 $35.00 $455.00 $52.00 $676.00 $41.00 $533.00
34  |New ABC, BC 5# 22 $35.00 $770.00 $45.00 $990.00 $75.00 $1,650.00 $51.00 $1,122.00
35  |NewABC,BC 10# 17 $60.00 $1,020.00 $75.00 $1,275.00 $95.00 $1,615.00 $82.00 $1,394.00
36 New ABC, BC 208 3 $115.00 $345.00 $140.00 $420.00 $165.00 $495.00 $147.00 $441.00
37 New 6L K Class 3 180.00 $540.00 $210.00 $630.00 $245.00 5$735,00 $229.00 $687.00
38 New CO2 5# 130.00 $149.00 NO BID $201.00
39  |NewCO2 104 $192.00 $209.00 NOBID $282.00
40 New CO2 15# $230.00 $253.00 NOBID $342.00
41 |New CO2 204 $285,00 $308.00 NOBID $415.00
42 New Halatron 2.54 $140.00 $198.00 NO BID $204.00
43 New Halatron 5# $230.00 $357.00 $225.00 $340.00
44 |New Halatron 11# $475.00 $695.00 5465.00 $702.00
45 Valve NOBID $11.00 $12.00 54,50
46 Gauge $6.00 $10.00 $9.00 $4,50
47 Suppression System Service [ $100.00 $600.00 $95.00%* 5570.00 $95.00 $570.00 $150.00 $900.00
48 Fusible Links 30 $15.00 $450.00 $10.00 5300.00 $12.00 $360.00 $6.00 $180.00
49 Pins $1.00 $1.00 $2.00 $0.50
50 Hood Cleaning per 5q Ft. 392 $15.00 $5,880.00 $15.00 $5,880.00 $9.50 $3,724,00 $36.00 $14,112.00
51 Hood Cleaning per Each Nozzle NO BID Included with Above NO BID 554,00
52 ORing Included Included Included Included
TOTAL (items 1-51)
Pickup/Delivery Charge (Pre Round Trip) $25.00 $75.00 NOBID $65.00
Service Charge for Callouts Other Than Annual
Inspection $25.00 $70.00%* $45.00 $67.00
Total $12,502.00 $14,900.00 $14,745.00 $24,679.00
» Comment: New
ik Comment: 1st Cylinder
ks Comment: $70.00/hour ST - 2 hour minimum; $112.00/hour OT - 4 hour minimum
Recommendation:
T sf of my kno this is an accurate Bid Tabulafion

Sign e
J raceno, Fire Maintenance Supervisor

Signature
Erin Wolfe, Purchasing Manager




