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STATE OF ALABAMA X
COUNTY OF BALDWIN X

The City Council, City of Fairhope, met in regular session at
6:00 p.m., Fairhope Municipal Complex Council Chamber,
161 North Section Street, Fairhope, Alabama 36532, on

Monday, 10 January 2022.

Present were Council President Jimmy Conyers, Councilmembers: Jack,
Burrell, Corey Martin, Jay Robinson, and Kevin Boone, Mayor Sherry Sullivan, City
Attorney Marcus E. McDowell, and City Clerk Lisa A. Hanks.

There being a quorum present, Council President Burrell called the meeting to
order. The invocation was given by Reverend A. B. Sawyer, former Associate Pastor
of First Baptist Church, and the Pledge of Allegiance was recited. Councilmember
Martin moved to approve minutes of the 22 December 2021, regular meeting.
Seconded by Councilmember Boone, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Council President Conyers stated there was a need to add on two agenda items
after Agenda Item Number 14: a resolution that Mayor Sherry Sullivan is hereby
authorized to execute an Indemnity and Hold Harmless Agreement between Adcock
Home Builders and the City of Fairhope regarding the design, maintenance, function,
and effectiveness of the bio-retention swale as presented in Exhibit “A”; and a
resolution that Mayor Sherry Sullivan or a Councilmember is authorized to execute a
services agreement with Ultimate XP, LLC to provide Covid testing, supplies and
specimen collection services on January 15, 2022 at the Fairhope Point Clear Rotary
Youth Club or any other future site.

Councilmember Burrell moved to add on the above-mentioned items not on
the printed agenda. Seconded by Councilmember Robinson, motion passed
unanimously by voice vote.

Mayor Sullivan addressed the City Council and congratulated City Treasurer
Kim Creech and Senior Accountant Aislinn Stone for receiving the GFOA Certificate
of Achievement for Excellence in Financial Reporting. She said the water outages
have been unplanned and planned; and asked everyone to be patient over the next
three years. Mayor Sullivan announced the State of the City will be held on February
10, 2022 between 5:30 p.m. to 7:30 p.m. She said by the next meeting we should be
in the Symbol Clinic. Mayor Sullivan mentioned the Church Street and Morphy
Avenue intersection is open; and the upcoming Comp Plan Steering Committee
meeting.

Councilmember Burrell said the Eastern Shore Metropolitan Planning
Organization framework for new bridge was sent to ALDOT; and all five points were
approved.
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Councilmember Martin told everyone Happy New Year; and asked everyone
to keep the Ladd family in their prayers. He mentioned the water outages; and said he
drove by one of the outages and those employees work hard. He also said the Comp
Plan and State of the City are events that citizens should attend. Councilmember
Martin announced on January 15, 2022 a COVID testing site will be at the Fairhope-
Point Clear Rotary Youth Club on Young Street.

Councilmember Burrell introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that Mayor Sherry Sullivan is authorized to
execute the Tax Revenue Enhancement Agreement between AVENU Insights &
Analytics, LLC and the City of Fairhope for Business License Discovery/Recovery.
Seconded by Councilmember Robinson, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

RESOLUTION NO. 4332-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, that Mayor Sherry Sullivan is hereby authorized to
execute the Tax Revenue Enhancement Agreement between AVENU Insights &
Analytics, LLC and the City of Fairhope for Business License Discovery/Recovery.

DULY ADOPTED THIS 10TH DAY OF JANUARY, 2022

()%t C L)

gﬁnes Reid Conyer§, Jr.
ou

ncil President

Councilmember Burrell introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that the City of Fairhope authorizes submission
of a HMGP grant to AEMA requesting grant funds to construct a first-responder safe
room; estimated total $1,933,180.00 of project cost and the City of Fairhope is
matching funds estimated at $329,929.00. City Council authorizes Mayor Sherry
Sullivan to sign all required grant application documents on behalf of City. Seconded
by Councilmember Martin, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.
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RESOLUTION NO. 4333-22

AUTHORIZING THE SPONSORSHIP OF A HAZARD MITIGATION
GRANT APPLICATION TO THE ALABAMA EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT
AGENCY TO CONSTRUCT A FIRST-RESPONDER SAFE ROOM FOR THE
CITY OF FAIRHOPE, BALDWIN COUNTY, ALABAMA

WHEREAS, the Alabama Emergency Management Agency (AEMA) is accepting
applications from municipal governments for Hazard Mitigation Grant Program (HMGP)
funds; and

WHEREAS, the City of Fairhope has identified the need for a first-responder safe room;

WHEREAS, if funded, the grant will pay 75% of the estimated total project costs or
$1,933,180.00 and the City of Fairhope will be responsible for providing 25% of the
estimated total project costs or $460,429.00;

WHEREAS, part of the City’s funding will be made up of owner in-kind property at the
safe room location on Pecan Street, which is $130,500.00 or 75 percent of the appraised

value or $174,000.00, making the City of Fairhope’s total cash match an estimated
$329,929.00;

WHEREAS, the City’s Public Utilities Department will provide oversight of the project,
if funded;

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY
OF FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, IN REGULAR SESSION ASSEMBLED, that by this
Resolution the City of Fairhope authorizes submission of an HMGP grant to AEMA
requesting grant funds to construct a first-responder safe room;

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Council authorizes the Mayor to sign all
required grant application documents on behalf of the City.

DONE, under the Seal of the City of Fairhope this 10th day of January, 2022.

Mol )

s Reid Conyeyy r.
Counc-.l President

ATTEST:
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Councilmember Robinson introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption
of the following resolution, a resolution that Mayor Sherry Sullivan is authorized to
execute Change Order No. | for (Bid Number 040-21) NRCS-EWP DSR 5106-Proj
#1 Quail Creek, for removal and repair of additional 60 linear feet of 10 ft. wide cart
path that had been heavily damaged prior to construction beginning for an increase
cost of $4,547.27 and to award Change Order No. 1 to John G. Walton Construction.
The new contract total will be $404,250.00. Seconded by Councilmember Boone,
motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

RESOLUTION NO. 4334-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, That Mayor Sherry Sullivan is hereby authorized to
execute Change Order No. | for (Bid Number 040-21) NRCS-EWP DSR 5106-Proj
#1 Quail Creek, for the removal and repair of an additional 60 linear feet of 10 ft.
wide cart path that had been heavily damaged prior to construction beginning for an
increase cost of $4,547.27 and to award Change Order No. 1 to John G. Walton
Construction. The new contract total will be $404,250.00.

Adopted on this 10th day of Januag 2022

lmmy Reid Conyer: Ars/h'y

Council President

Attest:

éiﬁ; A
ity Clerk

Councilmember Burrell introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that Mayor Sherry Sullivan is authorized to
execute Change Order No. 2 for (Bid Number 010-20) Church Street Utility and
Drainage Improvements to change waterline material to Class 350 Ductile Iron. The
project was originally bid with an 8” C-900 PVC water main, which met the City’s
specifications at the time. The change order came at the request to change the
material to 8" Class 350 Ductile Iron to comply with the City’s new standard
specifications regarding the type of material allowed for water mains by increasing
cost in the amount of $71,327.75 and to award Change Order No. 2 to Asphalt
Services, Inc. Seconded by Councilmember Boone, motion passed unanimously by
voice vote.
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RESOLUTION NO. 4335-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, That Mayor Sherry Sullivan is hereby authorized to
execute Change Order No. 2 for (Bid Number 010-20) Church Street Utility and
Drainage Improvements to change waterline material to Class 350 Ductile Iron. The
project was originally bid with an 8 C-900 PVC water main, which met the City’s
specifications at the time. The change order came at the request to change the
material to 8 Class 350 Ductile Iron to comply with the City’s new standard
specifications regarding the type of material allowed for water mains by increasing
cost in the amount of $71,327.75 and to award Change Order No. 2 to Asphalt
Services, Inc.

Adopted on this 10th day of January, 2022

/7 M@é)

J}fﬁmy Reid Conysr’sl Jr.
Council President

Attest:

Lisa A.
City Clerk

Councilmember Boone introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution to Award Bid to Blade Construction LLC for
Arts Alley Downtown Transit Hub with a total bid proposal of $1,237,582.23 (Bid
Number 001-22). Seconded by Councilmember Martin, motion passed unanimously
by voice vote.
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RESOLUTION NO. 4336-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, as follows:

[1] That the City of Fairhope did request, receive, and open bids for Arts Alley
Downtown Transit Hub for the Public Works Department (Bid Number 001-22) at
555 South Section Street in the City of Fairhope offices, Fairhope, Alabama. The
Invitation to Bid No. 001-22 Arts Alley Transit Hub was posted to the City’s website
on Thursday, October 14, 2021, and viewed by eighty-eight (88) vendors of the three-
hundred and fifteen (315) e-notification recipients on the City’s website. Five (5)
vendors attended the Mandatory Pre-Bid held on Thursday, November 4, 2021, at
2:30 p.m.

[2] At the appointed time and place, the City received two (2) bids from Blade
Construction, LLC and Highland Wake Construction, LLC. They were opened and
tabulated.

[3] After evaluating the bid proposals with the required bid specifications, Blade
Construction LLC with total bid proposal of $1,237,582.23, is now awarded the bid
for Arts Alley Downtown Transit Hub. Contingent on project authorization from
funding stakeholders.

Adopted on this 10th day of January, 2022

C KD

Jimy Reid Cony;r{'.lr
ouncil President

Attest:
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Councilmember Burrell introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution to Award Bid to TTB Inc. d/b/a ServiceMaster
Action Cleaning for janitorial services including supplies not to exceed $79,500.00,
carpet cleaning $8,406.30, and floor waxing $14,504.05 for a total bid proposal not-
to-exceed $102,410.35 (Bid Number 037-21). Seconded by Councilmember Martin,
motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

RESOLUTION NO. 4337-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, as follows:

[1] That the City of Fairhope did request, receive, and open bids for Janitorial
Services for City Buildings for the City (Bid No. 037-21) at 555 South Section Street
in the City of Fairhope offices, Fairhope, Alabama.

[2] At the appointed time and place, the following bids were opened and tabulated as
follows:

Please see attached Bid Tabulation for

Janitorial Services for City Buildings

[3] After evaluating the bid proposals with the required bid specifications, TTB Inc
dba ServiceMaster Action Cleaning, with a bid proposal for janitorial services
including supplies not-to-exceed $79,500.00, carpet cleaning $8,406.30, and floor
waxing $14,504.05 for a total not-to-exceed $102,410.35 shown in the attached bid
tabulation, is now the awarded bid for the City.

Adopted on this 10th day of January, 2022

imty Reid Conyeps’, Jr. b

Zouncil President
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CITY OF FARHOPE Tab
Bid 037-21 Janitorial Services for City Buiidings
Opened August 16, 2021 ot 10 AM.

[Executive Ciesning Inc. No Bid _ No Bid TNo B0 No Bid No
17 Y
Y :
Y s

Executive Ci Inc
Jani-King of Mobue
Mobie Janilonal
ServiceMasler Clean

c Linkings Bailding

Carpet Claani ‘Wanlng

initisl Term 12 months Total Sullding Totsl Buddng
Executive Cleaning Inc No B No |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Em
[Jani-King of Mobde 7.00 1028400 |No Bid No Bid No No Bid
Mobie lantorial 50 10,566.00 5 25 $0.60 $1,467.50
ServiceMaster Clean 00 10,032 00 .10 3250.00 55 $350.00

t Clsgn Waring

initial Term 12 months P Total |sart o1l Bulicing
[Exacumve ing Inc No Bd No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid
Jani-King of Mcbile 00 8.00 No 8 No ] No Bd
Mobie J 08000 19015 $127 50 60 25 00
ServiceMaster Crean $700.00 400, $0.10 $250.00 $0.55 $350 00

Carpet Cesning Wanng

Initial Term 12 momhs Saft Total Buildng  iSqft ‘otal Bull
Executive Cleaning Inc No Bid [ No Bl No Bid No Bid NO
Jani-King of Mobie 236 00 No No Bid No B No Bid
Mobie Ju 887 00 $22.844.00 .18 3.60 $C 50 145 00
ServiceMaster Clean 3123100 14.772.00 10 $250.00 5 838600 |
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Execuive nc
Janu-King
Mobile Jan) I
Clean

rnlza—an e 8

Signalure

George Ladd, Public Works Assistant Director
Cf—? Fousoa

Signatre

Cory Pierce, Purchasing Manager

Councilmember Burrell introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that the City of Fairhope has voted to procure
three (3) in-car and three (3) body cameras for the Police Department from
WatchGuard Video as Sole Source Distributor; and authorizes procurement based on
the option allowed by the Code of Alabama 1975, Section 41-16-51(13). The cost
will be $18,840.00. Seconded by Councilmember Robinson, motion passed
unanimously by voice vote.
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RESOLUTION NO. 4338-22
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, as follows:
[1] That the City of Fairhope has voted to procure three (3) in-car and three (3) body
cameras for the Police Department from WatchGuard Video as Sole Source
Distributor; and authorizes procurement based on the option allowed by the Code of

Alabama 1975, Section 41-16-51(13). The cost will be $18,840.00.

Adopted on this 10th day of January, 2022

CIR00 0.
¥ , ,.L e
Jimpdy Reid ConyergTr. /
Cofincil President

Attest:

és”a A. H%ks, MéC

City Clerk

Councilmember Burrell introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that the City of Fairhope has voted to purchase
two (2) 2022 Ford F-250 Crew Cab 4 x 2 Pickups or equivalent for the Public Works
Department; and the type of vehicles needed are on the Alabama State Department of
Purchasing bid list and therefore does not have to be let out for bid estimated cost of
§77,976.00 equivalent not-to-exceed. Seconded by Councilmember Martin, motion
passed unanimously by voice vote.
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RESOLUTION NO. 4339-22
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, as follows:
[1] That the City of Fairhope has voted to procure two (2) 2022 Ford F-250 Crew Cab
4 x 2 Pickups or equivalent for the Public Works Department; and the type of
vehicles needed are on the Alabama State Department of Purchasing bid list and

therefore does not have to be let out for bid; and

[2] The following is the Alabama State Department of Purchasing contract
information:

Bid Number: T191
Two (2) 2022 Ford F-250 Crew Cab 4 x 2 Pickups or Equivalent
not-to-exceed $77,976.00

Adopted on this 10th day of January, 2022

Jr.

Couhcil President

City Clerk

Councilmember Burrell introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that the City of Fairhope has voted to approve
the repair of boom on Truck #1088 for the Electric Department from Terex Utilities
as Sole Source Distributor; and authorizes procurement based on the option allowed
by the Code of Alabama 1975, Section 41-16-51(13). The cost will be $16,365.80.
Seconded by Councilmember Boone, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.
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RESOLUTION NO. 4340-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, as follows:

[1] That the City of Fairhope has voted to approve the repair of boom on Truck #1088
for the Electric Department from Terex Utilities as Sole Source Distributor; and
authorizes procurement based on the option allowed by the Code of Alabama 1975,
Section 41-16-51(13). The cost will be $16,365.80.

Adopted on this 10th day of January, 2022

O/ O

Jlm?ﬂl Reid C onygré/j;

Council President

Attest:

City Clerk

Councilmember Burrell moved to appoint Jeff Windham to the Industrial
Development Board for a six-year term which will expire January 2028. Seconded by
Councilmember Robinson, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Councilmember Martin introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that Mayor Sherry Sullivan is hereby authorized
to execute an Indemnity and Hold Harmless Agreement between Adcock Home
Builders and the City of Fairhope regarding the design, maintenance, function, and
effectiveness of the bio-retention swale as presented in Exhibit “A.” Seconded by
Councilmember Boone, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.
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RESOLUTION NO. 4341-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF FAIRHOPE,
ALABAMA, That Mayor Sherry Sullivan is hereby authorized to execute an Indemnity and
Hold Harmless Agreement between Adcock Home Builders and the City of Fairhope
regarding the design, maintenance, function, and effectiveness of the bio-retention swale as
presented in Exhibit “A.”

DULY ADOPTED THIS 10TH DAY OF JANUARY, 2021

Attest:
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Councilmember Burrell introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that Mayor Sherry Sullivan or a Councilmember
is authorized to execute a services agreement with Ultimate XP, LLC to provide
Covid testing, supplies and specimen collection services on January 15, 2022 at the
Fairhope Point Clear Rotary Youth Club or any other future site. Seconded by
Councilmember Boone, motion passed unanimously by voice vote. Councilmember
Martin stated that the event will be from 1:00 p.m. to 6:00 p.m.

RESOLUTION NO. 4342-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF FAIRHOPE,
ALABAMA, That Mayor Sherry Sullivan or a Councilmember is authorized to execute a
services agreement with Ultimate XP, LLC to provide Covid testing, supplies and specimen
collection services on January 15, 2022 at the Fairhope Point Clear Rotary Youth Club or any
other future site.

Adopted on this 10th day of January, 2022

Cofincil President

Attest:

i1sa A. Hanks, MMC
City Clerk

At the request of the City Attorney, Marcus E. McDowell, the City Council
will rise from the meeting to go into Executive Session based on Section 36-25A-
7(a)(3) to discuss pending and potential litigation. The approximate time to be in
Executive Session is 7 minutes. Councilmember Burrell moved to go into Executive
Session. Seconded by Councilmember Martin, motion passed unanimously by voice
vote.

Exited the dais at 6:23 p.m. Returned at 6:35 p.m.

Council President Conyers stated there was a need to add on an agenda item
after Agenda Item Number 16: a resolution authorizing the Mayor to sign a legal
services contract between Riley & Jackson, P.C. and Wilkins, Bankester, Biles &
Wynne, P.A. (“Law Firm”) and the City of Fairhope to represent the City of Fairhope
in the prosecution of legal claims regarding opioids.
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Councilmember Burrell moved to add on the above-mentioned item not on the
printed agenda. Seconded by Councilmember Boone, motion passed unanimously by
voice vote. Councilmember Robinson said he would be abstaining from the vote on
the resolution.

Councilmember Boone introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution that the Mayor is hereby authorized to sign a
legal services contract between Riley & Jackson, P.C. and Wilkins, Bankester, Biles
& Wynne, P.A. (“Law Firm”) and the City of Fairhope, Alabama for Law Firm to
represent the City of Fairhope in the prosecution of legal claims against
manufacturers’ and distributors’ fraudulent and negligent marketing and distribution
of opioids, pharmacies that dispensed opioids, and related matter. Resolution shall be
added to the Minutes of the Council’s meeting. Seconded by Councilmember Burrell,
motion passed by the following voice votes: AYES — Burrell, Martin, Conyers, and
Boone. NAY — None. ABSTAIN - Robinson.

RESOLUTION NO. 4343-22

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, Resolution — That the Mayor is hereby authorized to sign
a legal services contract between Riley & Jackson, P.C. and Wilkins, Bankester, Biles
& Wynne, P.A. (“Law Firm”) and the City of Fairhope, Alabama for Law Firm to
represent the City of Fairhope in the prosecution of legal claims against
manufacturers’ and distributors’ fraudulent and negligent marketing and distribution
of opioids, pharmacies that dispensed opioids, and related matter. Resolution shall be
added to the Minutes of the Council’s meeting.

Adopted on this 10th day of January, 2022

eségld Conyer{ /4

nc11 President
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Councilmember Burrell moved to adjourn the meeting. Seconded by
Councilmember Martin, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

There being no further business to come before the City Council, the meeting
was duly adjourned at 6:37 p.m.

s Reld Conyers
Councﬂ President

@MC
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