CITY OF FAIRHOPE BID TAB AND RECOMMENDATION
BID 024-19 Pedestrian Sidewalks in Central Business District
OPENING: Wednesday, August 7, 2019 9:00 a.m.

KELLEY'S WELDING &
EXCAVATION, INC

Section Street (Pine Street Intersection) QUANTITY UNITS UNIT PRICE SUBTOTAL

Pavement Demolition 1,500 SF S 1.75 | S 2,625.00
Curbing Demolition 25 LF S 5.00 | $ 125.00
New ADA Pedestrian Dome mats 11 EA S 500.00 | $ 5,500.00
Soil Excavation & Haul (Paving) 33 cY S 20.00 | S 660.00
New P.I.P. Concrete Curb and Gutter 200 LF S 25.00 | $ 5,000.00
New P.I.P. Concrete Ribbon Curb 225 LF $ 25.00 | S 5,625.00
New Paver Crosswalk 790 SF S 25.00 | $ 19,750.00
12" Concrete Drainage Channel 25 SF S 450.00 | $ 11,250.00
Soil Mitigation - Imported Planting Soil 17 cY S 25.00 | $ 425.00
TAPCO In-Pavement LED Markers 1 LS S 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00
Traffic Control 1 LS S 12,000.00 | S 12,000.00
Erosion Control 1 LS S 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00

Section Street (Pine Street Intersection) SUBTOTAL

Section Street (De La Mare Intersection) QUANTITY UNIT PRICE SUBTOTAL

Pavement Demolition 6,800 SF S 1.75 | $ 11,900.00

Striping Removal 205 SF S 3.00 (S 615.00
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Curbing Demolition 315 LF S 5.00 | $ 1,575.00
Conc/brick Ped Ramps Removal 470 SF S 3.00 | $ 1,410.00
Bituminous Treatment A 25 Sy S 5.00 | $ 125.00
Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer 3 TONS S 750.00 | $ 2,250.00
Soil Excavation & Haul (Paving) 106 cY S 20.00 | $ 2,120.00
New P.1.P. Concrete Curb and Gutter 500 LF S 25.00 | $ 12,500.00
New P.I.P. Concrete Ribbon Curb 900 LF S 25.00 | $ 22,500.00
New ADA Pedestrian Dome mats 8 EA S 500.00 | $ 4,000.00
New Paver Patio/walk 760 SF S 20.00 | $ 15,200.00
New Paver Crosswalk 800 SF S 25.00 | $ 20,000.00
24" Concrete Drainage Channel 150 SF S 575.00 | S 86,250.00
12" Concrete Drainage Channel 190 SF S 450.00 | S 85,500.00
Striping 40 LF S 2.00 (S 80.00
Soil Mitigation - Imported Planting Soil 40 cY S 25.00 | $ 1,000.00
Traffic Control 1 LS S 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
Erosion Control 1 LS S 2,750.00 | $ 2,750.00
Wheel Stop 1 EA S 150.00 | $ 150.00

Section Street (DeLaMar Intersection) SUBTOTAL

ADDITIVE ALTERNATE BID ITEM QUANTITY UNITS UNIT PRICE SUBTOTAL

New Paver Roadway 2,250 SF S 46.50 | S 104,625.00




CITY OF FAIRHOPE BID TAB AND RECOMMENDATION

BID 024-19 Pedestrian Sidewalks in Central Business District

OPENING: Wednesday, August 7, 2019 9:00 a.m.
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CITY PEDESTRIAN IMPROVEMENTS TOTAL
Section Street (Pine Street Intersection) S 124,460.00
Section Street (De La Mare Intersection) S 287,925.00
Mobilization S 14,500.00
Utility Adjustments S 2,000.00
TOTAL OF BASE BID B 428,885.00
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE BID ITEM
New Paver Roadway 104,625.00
TOTAL OF BASE BID + ADDITIVE ALTERNATE $ 533,510.00
ADDITIONAL BIDDERS RESULT
A-LONG BORING NO BID
AMMONS & BLACKMON NO BID
ASPHALT SERVICES NO BID
CUNNINGHAM DELANEY NO BID
EJ BUILDERS NO BID
JOHN G. WALTON CONSTRUCTION NO BID
MCELHENNEY CONSTRUCTION NO BID
W.R. MITCHELL NO BID
BALDWIN ROAD BUILDERS NO BID
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Chris Lieb, Engineer of Record

Date

Signature
Richard Johnson, Public Works Director

Signature
Delores A Brandt, Purchasing Manager



