City of Fairhope Tabulation
BID 037-19 Jail Inmate Meals 2019
Bid Opening: Wednesday, August 21, 2019 9:00 a.m.

Vendor: Winn Dixie

Option 2 - City to Pick Up

Vendor: American Foods

Option 1 - Vendor Delivery |

AMERICAN FOODS PRICE DISCREPANCIES

ITEM

Breakfast

PRICE
EACH

UNITS
PER CASE

UNIT
SIZE

BID PRICE
PER CASE

VENDOR
COMPLIANT

ITEM

Breakfast

PRICE EACH

BID PRICE
PER CASE

VENDOR
COMPLIANT

PRICE
EACH

UNITS
PER
CASE

BID PRICE
PER CASE

DIFFERENCE

Lunch and Dinner
Fried Chicken Dinner

Lunch and Dinner

Pancakes & Sausage NO BID Pancakes & Sausage S 2.07 24.86 YES S 2.07 12 S 2484 | S 0.02
Eggs, Bacon, & Hash Brown Eggs, Bacon, & Hash Brown
. 70Z . YES 14 25.75 YES

Potatoes 2.3 8 i Potatoes > 2 SEe2dA 125 S 25.68 | S 0.07
Eggs, Sausage, & Hash Brown Eggs, Sausage, & Hash Brown

2.99 8 70Z 23.92 YES 2. 19.32 YES
Potatoes O 2 Potatoes ? Al 52241 8 S 19.28 | § 0.04
French Toast NO BID French Toast S 1.73 20.83 YES S 1.73 12 S 20.76 | § 0.07
Omelets Omelets S S 26.04 | § 0.11

Fried Chicken Dinner S 3.88 8 $ 31.10 YES S 3.88 8 S 31.04 | S

Chicken Nugget Dinner 1.49 12 7402 |S$ 17.88 YES Chicken Nugget Dinner $ 3.34 8 $ 26.74 YES S 3.34 8 |S 2672 | S 0.02
Chicken Finger Dinner 1.49 12 7407 |$ 17.88 YES Chicken Finger Dinner $ 3.34 8 $ 26.74 YES S 334 8 S 26.72 | S 0.02
Boneless Pork Dinner 1.49 12 740Z | § 17.88 YES Boneless Pork Dinner S 3.34 8 S 26.74 YES S 3.34 8 S 2672 | S 0.02
Hamburger Dinner NO BID Hamburger Dinner $ 2.73 8 S 21.90 S w973 8 S 21.84 | S 0.06
Barbecue Chicken Dinner 3.69 8 1520z $ 2952 YES Barbecue Chicken Dinner 5 3.34 8 S 26.74 YES S 334 8 |$ 26.72 | $ 0.02
Turkey Dinner S 3.69 8 160Z | § 29.52 YES Turkey Dinner S 3.34 8 S 26.74 YES S 3.34 8 S 2672 | S 0.02
Salishury Steak Dinner 1.49 12 11.80Z|$ 17.88 YES Salisbury Steak Dinner S 3.34 8 S 26.74 YES S 334 8 |$ 2672 | S 0.02
Fish Stick Dinner NO BID Fish Stick Dinner S 3.36 8 § 25.08 YES S 336 8|S 26.88|S  (1.80)
Swedish Meatballs & Noodles NO BID Swedish Meatballs & Noodles $ 157 12 S 18.90 YES $ 1.57 12 $ 18.84 | $ 0.06
Pot Roast with Gravy and Pot Roast with Gravy and

Vegetables ! 3.99 8 1507 > 31.92 s Vegetables Y 5 3.13 5 i WES S.:313 8 |S 25.04 | § 0.04
Fried Rice Dinner $  1.29 12 80z |$ 15.48 YES Fried Rice Dinner 8 3.94 $ 31.52 YES S 394 8 |$ 3152 | S -
Country Fried Steak Dinner 3.69 8 1602 | $ 29.52 YES Country Fried Steak Dinner $ 3.34 $ 26.74 YES S 334 8 S 26.72 | S 0.02
Sweet & Sour Chicken Dinner 1.49 12 9.507 S 17.88 YES Sweet & Sour Chicken Dinner $ 334 S 26.74 YES 3 3.34 8 3 2672 % 0.02




City of Fairhope Tabulation
BID 037-19 Jail Inmate Meals 2019
Bid Opening: Wednesday, August 21, 2019 9:00 a.m.

Meat Loaf Dinner with Gravy ¢ 1.49 12 11.88 07 S 17.88 YES Meat Loaf Dinner with Gravy S 334 g 16 07 S 26.74 YES 5 334 g $ 96721 % 0.02
Chicken Stuffed Baked with Chicken Stuffed Baked with
Gravy_ NOBID Gravy $ 3.34 8 130z |° 2675 ¥ES S 0334 8 |5 26.72 | S 0.02
Beef Enchilada Dinner $ 3.99 8 1202 | $ 3192 YES Beef Enchilada Dinner $ 3.88 8 160zZ | $ 31.10 YES S 1388 8] s 31.04 | S 0.06
Beef Patty with Country Style Beef Patty with Country Style
vessabls ¢ 38| 49 |dpoy |° 9B VB L iobles $ 33| 8 | 150z |° i T Siaaag |He | st il is o0
Spaghetti Dinner S 149| 12 100z | $ 17.88 YES Spaghetti Dinner s 3.70| 8 |1330z|$ 29.60 YES e o B B 29.60 | $ -
Lasagna Dinner S 3.99 12 190z | $ 47.88 YES Lasagna Dinner S 341 12 190Z | S 40.94 YES SRt w2 s s 40.92 | S 0.02
Pizza, Pepperoni (individual Pizza, Pepperoni (individual
5 520z [? 2000]  YES s 194| 20 | soz |7 3883 Y  Me aoa| 20 |¢ 3380l o013

Miscellaneous Provisions Miscellaneous Provisions
Bread, White, Sandwich style Bread, White, Sandwich style
loaf s 199 1 oz |* 199 YES ) o $  313| 10 | 240z |° s g a3 0|80 380 006
Bread, Whole Wheat Bread, Whole Wheat

) , 2.2 ’ ! 1. YES

Sandwich style loaf 5 229 1 2007 2 “ ¥E3 Sandwich style loaf $ 3.14 10 24 0Z 3 31.44 S 341710 55 3140 | $ 0.04
Milk, 2%, ¥ pt. serving s  1.79 12 140zZ | S 2148 YES Milk, 2%, % pt. serving $ 0.39| 48 SPT | S 19.22 YES S 039 48 |S 18.72 | $ 0.50
Orange Juice, 100%, % pt. Orange Juice, 100%, ¥ pt.
serving § uzs| @ | |F BE ¥ o § ou| w | eoz |¥ W5 VB gtiaor)iso|s =905 0
Gatorade, large container $  8.49 3 50.90Z| % 2547 YES Gatorade, large container g 9.28 4 GAL |s 37.15 YES S 9.28 4 |S 37.12 | S 0.03
Oranges, per each $ 1.50 i EA S 1.50 YES Oranges, per each S 0.74 12 EACH | S 8.90 YES SER07a | E123]S 8.88 |5 0.02
Apples, each S 1.69 1 LB S 1.69 YES Apples, each S 0.77 12 EACH | S 9.30 YES S=50.77 12 |S 9.24 | S 0.06
Tea Bags, gallon size NO BID Tea Bags, gallon size S 0.16| 96 10Z |% 15.26 YES ST0a6 ] 96 | S 15.36 | § (0.10)
Canned Mixed Fruit, Individual Canned Mixed Fruit, Individual
Serving s 249| 6 | apk [P M4 VES N ine $ om|aoz| s |¥ B YS Jdiipe3]| g6 |S E29ms|sl 00
Canned Peaches, Individual Canned Peaches, Individual
— s 249 6 4pic |7 WS YE N e s o083 a0z | 36 [® 298| Y ¢ o083| 36 |$ 2088 o005
Cereal, Individual box per Cereal, Individual box per
serving $ 449| 12 gpk | 38|  YES | ine s o072| 48 | 20z |° " B L o072 a8 356 |S 006
Assorted Chips, Individual Assorted Chips, Individual
Packaze s 799| 1 |asek [® T VB e $ o3s| e | zor |®  2BE7| VS Ne igan| sngls o ginold oy
Drink Mix, Fruit Punch S 2.49 12 6.30Z | § 29.88 YES Drink Mix, Fruit Punch S 1.77 12 2GAL | S 21.26 YES S 177 1228 21.24 | S 0.02
Drink Mix, Lemonade $  4.39 12 1907 | S 5268 YES Drink Mix, Lemonade S 1.77 | 12 2GAL | $ 21.26 YES SEEA g7 =125 S 21.24 | S 0.02
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Drink Mix, Grape $  4.39 i2 190Z | S 52.68 YES Drink Mix, Grape S 1.77 | 12 2GAL | § 21.26 YES SHALTT | =120 s 21.24 | S 0.02
Cookies, Chocolate Chip $ 299 12 130Z | $ 35.88 YES Cookies, Chocolate Chip S 0.23 | 144 107 |s 34.16 YES Soa0.23 ] =144 S 33425 1.04
Cookies, Misc. selection S 1.99 12 250Z | S 23.88 YES Cookies, Misc. selection S 0.36 10 LBS S 36.60 YES S 0.36 10 | S 360 (S 33.00
Crackers, individual pack $ 1.99 12 7.330Z|$ 23.88 YES Crackers, individual pack S 0.08 | 300 2PK | S 17.32 YES S 0.08| 300 |S 2400 S  (6.68)
Mustard, individual packets NO BID Mustard, individual packets $ 004! 200 S 9.15 YES $ 0.04| 200 | 8.00 | ¢ 1.15
Mayonnaise, individual packets NO BID Mayonnaise, individual packets g 0.10 200 S 20.13 YES S 010| 200 | 2000 | $ 0.13
Ketchup, individual packets NO BID Ketchup, individual packets 5 0.02 | 1000 $ 23.74 YES S 0.02] 1000 (S 20.00 | $ 3.74
Syrup, individual packets NO BID Syrup, individual packets S 0.17 | 100 S 17.14 YES S a0.17.] 81005 5 17.00 | § 0.14
Syrup, 1-gal container (or Syrup, 1-gal container (or
athersize] s s28| 9 |moz|® VO B Ly &  gam] u GaL | ° MLl ¥B Jesdgaz| i1l 7.47 | $ s
Jelly, misc. selection in lelly, misc. selection in

NO BID : E
individual packets individual packets S 0.07 [ 200 502 2 et L 555:0.07] 32005 5 14.00 | S (0.52)
Salad, Mixed $ 3.79 6 90z |$ 2274 YES Salad, Mixed $ 1.69 1 5B |$ 8.45 YES 551,69 1055 1.69 | S 6.76
Spices, Garlic Powder $ 100 6 2870z $  6.00 YES Spices, Garlic Powder $ 0.06 1 1907 | S 11.57 YES 520,06 L] 5 006 |5 1151
Pepper, Individual paper Pepper, Individual paper
packets U ket $  005| 6000 | case |° 4508 ¥ $ 0006|6000 |$ 36005 (0.44)
Salt, Individual paper packets NO BID Salt, Individual paper packets $ 0.04| 6000 CASE S 27.86 YES $  0.005 | 6000 | $ 30.00 | $ (2.14)
ACTUAL TOTALS $110.60 $911.12 ACTUAL TOTALS $ 115.10 $ 1,326.54 $ 115.02 $ 127794 S 48.60
TOTALS SUBMITTED BY TOTALS SUBMITTED BY
VENDOR $ 12.99 VENDOR $1,326.54
Additional Bidders Delivery Pick-Up
Greer's Fairhope Market NO BID NO BID
Publix NO BID NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID NO BID
American Wholesale Grocery BID NO BID
Wood Fruitticher NO BID NO BID
Sam's Club NO BID NO BID
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Cain's Piggly Wiggly NO BID NO BID
Winn-Dixie NO BID BID

Merchants Food Service NO BID NO BID
Shipyard Supply NO BID NO BID
Rouses Market NO BID NO BID
Walmart NO BID NO BID

Discrepancies were found in the American Foods bid for case pricing. The shaded area represents the corrections and agreed to pricing with American Foods.
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