CITY OF FAIRHOPE

BID TABULATION
Bid Name: Fitness Equipment for Recreation Center 2018
Bid Number: 01518
Date Opened: 517/2018 9:00 AM
Bld Proposal
Executed /
Signed /
Notarized/Non-
Colluslon Extended
Statement Addendum Price to
Signed / # &#H2 No.of [ PRICE |include
Vendor = Notarized | esigned |ARODAYS| MANUFACTURER | ITEMS | PER ITEM installation
MATRIX FITNESS _yes 45
T7xe [or equivalent) Treadmiils MATRIX FITNESS | 3 5,205.00| $18,285, UU
[A7xe {or equivalent) Ascent Trainer MATRIX FITNESS 4 .
G3-MS50 {or equivalent) 5-Stack Multi-Station MATRIX FITNESS 1| $7.675.00] 8_.4_50.00
MG-PLE2 (or equivalent) Matrix MG Smith Machine MATRIX FITNESS | 1 |$1,395.00] §1,745.00
x*r-azs RUB R-Plate (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 0.25 Calor MATRIX FITNESS | 2 .80 16.30
Sl sttt LT Robbes i O G A )
XT 10 RUBR -Plate (or equivalent} XULT ber Plate or C1INE 1 i
RUBR-Plate {or equivalent L'iL LT Rubber Plate 25 color | [ [ | MATRIX FITNESS 4 86 | $266.40
'r-35 RUBR-Flata {or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 35 Color - MATRIXFITNESS | 4 $74.30 | $456.45
IXT-45 RUBR-Plate {or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 46 Color e MATRIX FITNESS | 6 100.80 | $913.86 1
‘reig
TOTAL PRICE | $54.783.77
BSN Sports yos 2-3 weeks
T7xe (or equivalent) Treadmills — Spirit Fitness 3 |§3,949.98| $11,849.94
ATxe (or equivalent) Ascent Trainer _ Spirit Fitness 4 |$3199.98] $12799.92| |
G3-MS50 (or equivalent) 5-Stack Multi-Station NoBid | 1 No Bid No Bid
MG-PL62 (or equivalent} Matrix MG Smith Machine RSP ___NoBid 1 NoBid | NoBld
XT-0.25 RUBR-Plate {or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 0.25 Color & = No Bid 2 Na Bid No Bid
XT-05 RUBR-Plate (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 05 Color ____NoBid 6 No Bid No Bid
[XT-10 RUBR-Flate (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Flate 10 Calor - No Bid 6 | NoBid No Bid
XT-25 RUBR-Plata (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 25 Color No Bid 4 No Bid No Bid
XT-35 RUBR-Plate (or equivalent} XULT Rubber Plate 35 Color No Bid 4 No Bid No Bid
XT-45 RUBR-Plate {or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 45 Color No Bid 6 No Bid No Bid
| Freight $790.50
TOTAL PRICE $25,440.36
PROMAXIMA--— no 4-8 weeks
T7xe {or equivalent) Treadmills e 3 $4,999.00 $14,887.00
AT7xe (or equivalent) Ascent Tralner 4 |$5,299.00| $21,196.00
G3-MS50 (or equivalent) 5-Stack Multi-Station | 11— | | 1 ﬁg 279.00| $5,279.00
MG-PLB2 (or equivalent) Matrix MG $mith Machine I A — 1 $1,595.00] $1,585.00
XT-0,256 RUER-Plate (or equl uivalent) XULT Rubber Piate 0.25 Calor e TR 2 $2.50 $5.00
XT-05 RUBR-Plate (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 05 Color a B - 6 $5.00 $30.00
XT-10 RUBR-Plate {or equivalent] [XULT Rubber Plate 10 Calor . o o 6 §10.00 $80.00
XT-26 RUBR-Plate {or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 26 Calor I R - | 4 | s2500 $100,00
XT-35 RUBR-Plate {or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 35 Color 4 $35.00 | $140.00
XT-45 RUBR-Plate (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 4§ Color [ $45.00 $270.00
Freight $3,100.00
S TOTA’L PRICE| $46,772.00
FITNESS MASTER yos 21 dave
T7xe {or equivalent) Treadmills TRUE $6,286.00| $16,158.00
|A7xe (or equivalent) Asgent Tralner OCTANE $6,508.00| $26,432,00
|G3-MS50 (or equivalent) 5-Stack Multi-Station HOIST $6,794.00F §7,044.00
MG-PL62 (or equivalent) Matrix MG Smith Machine TRUE $1,685.00| $1,810.00
XT-0.25 RUBR-Plate (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 0.25 Color TROY §3.43 7| $6.86
XT-05 RUBR-Plate {or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 05 Color TROY .85 7| 84110
XT-10 RUBR-Plate (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 10 Color _ TROY 13.70 82.20
M‘Mﬂ!ﬂlm‘m XULT Rubber Plate 25 Color TROY §34.25 | $137.00
XT-35 RUBR-Plate (or equivalent) XULT Rubber Plate 35 Color TROY $47.95 §191.80
| XT-45 RUBR-Plate (or equivalent} XULT Rubber Plate 45 Color TROY $61.20 $367.20
Freight| $2,216.85
5 TOTAL PRICE| $54,485.95
Si¥ o140 18)
Tom Kuhl -

Director of Parks and Recreation




