| STATE OF ALABAMA  | )( |
|-------------------|----|
|                   | :  |
| COUNTY OF BALDWIN | )( |

The City Council, City of Fairhope, met in regular session at 6:00 p.m., Fairhope Municipal Complex Council Chamber, 161 North Section Street, Fairhope, Alabama 36532, on Monday, 14 September 2009.

Present were Council President Debbie W. Quinn, Councilmembers: Daniel Stankoski, Lonnie L. Mixon, Michael A. Ford, and Rick Kingrea, Mayor Timothy M. Kant, City Attorney Marion E. Wynne, and City Clerk Lisa A. Hanks.

There being a quorum present, Council President Quinn called the meeting to order. The invocation was given by Reverend Donald M. Smith, Priest at St. James Episcopal Church, and the Pledge of Allegiance was recited.

Council President Quinn announced that they needed to amend the agenda by adding on the following items: Resolution awarding the bid for Quail Creek Golf Course Food Service, Resolution authorizing Mayor Timothy M. Kant to execute an agreement with the Alabama Department of Transportation relating to a Transportation Enhancement project, and Executive Session to discuss current and pending litigation.

Councilmember Stankoski moved to address the above mentioned items **not** on the printed agenda. Seconded by Councilmember Mixon, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Councilmember Mixon moved to approve minutes of the 24 August 2009, regular meeting. Seconded by Councilmember Kingrea, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Sherry Sullivan made the following announcements:

- 22nd Annual Alabama Coastal Cleanup on Saturday, September 19, 2009 at 8:00 a.m.
- Fairhope High School will have its Draw Down on Saturday evening
- FEEF Phantasy of the Arts 2009, a benefit for the Fairhope Educational Enrichment Foundation, is set for Saturday, Sept. 26, 2009 at the Fairhope Civic Center at 6:30 p.m.
- Twitter.com You can now twitter The City of Fairhope.

Mayor Kant presented the following Proclamation to Robert A. Clark for all of his work as a member on the Industrial Development Board for the past 28 years:



© COPYRIGHT 2008 - MUNICIPALAWARDSCOMPANY.COM ~ CULIMAN, AL. (1958) 739-5957

Mr. Clark stated he enjoyed meeting people in the community and what sets our City aside from others are our volunteers; the citizens of the City of Fairhope.

Councilmember Ford addressed the City Council and questioned the August 4, 2009 letter from Mayor Kant regarding the Assistant Chief of Police position. Council President Quinn replied that the Police Chief and Gregg Mims had spoken to Mayor Kant and settled this matter. Mayor Kant said we just didn't follow the procedures. Councilmember Kingrea stated he shared the concern with following procedures and didn't want to expose ourselves for liabilities. He said if we have to go back and correct the error, we will appoint Terry Sanders as interim Assistant Chief of Police, ask the Mayor to post the job and give us his recommendation, and at the next meeting appointment Sanders as Assistant Chief of Police. City Attorney Wynne stated the Mayor did find a glitch and it has been settled. This issue will alert us for future decisions.

Gregg Mims, City Administrator, addressed the City Council and gave an update on projects being looked at in the Human Resources Department. The following is the list of projects discussed: monthly orientation for new employees and a tour of the City, quarterly training of supervisors, progressive discipline, drug training, safety, employee evaluations, workman's compensation, Blue Cross Blue Shield dos and don'ts, computer use, purchase order requests, substance abuse (zero tolerance), time management, department head annual reviews, job description and pay scales, and procedural manual and cheat sheets.

Lorenzo Howard, Personnel Board member, addressed the City Council and discussed supervisor training, specifically performance evaluations. He said there would be two sessions on this training: one for supervisors on goal setting process and motivation; and the second session would be for all employees. We hope to complete by the end of the year. We will be working on salary administration, performance, communication segments, and employee discipline by working toward goals and objectives.

Rhonda Bishop, Human Resources Director, addressed the City Council and briefly explained the job description for the Assistant City Clerk position. Ms. Bishop also recommended the salary range to be \$43,000 to \$50,000. She stated this was comparable to other cities. Mayor Kant stated that the only reason this position posted with a higher salary and requiring a Bachelor Degree in 2007 was the fact that Ms. Johnson was looking for her replacement. After further discussion, Councilmember Mixon moved to set the salary at \$43,000 for this position. The motion died for lack of a second.

Councilmember Stankoski then moved to set the beginning salary range from \$38,000 to \$43,000 for the Assistant City Clerk position. Seconded by Councilmember Kingrea, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Council President Quinn asked Ms. Bishop to explain the other open position. Ms. Bishop went over the position for the Mayor's Administrative Assistant and recommended a salary range of \$18.00 to \$21.00 per hour. Mayor Kant stated that the position for his Executive Secretary had already been posted for \$20.00 to \$25.00 per hour and received 71 applications for this position. He also mentioned interviews were scheduled to begin this week. Mayor Kant also questioned whether or not he could hire his own secretary. Ms. Bishop stated the Personnel Board was trying to unify the administrative assistant positions and keep salary ranges comparable. Councilmember Ford questioned the City Council; you are going to hire the Mayor's assistant. Ms. Bishop also mentioned that the position required good computer skills, a Bachelor Degree, or equivalent experience which would be around 10 to 15 years experience.

After further discussion, Councilmember Kingrea moved to pass this item until the next City Council meeting which will be on September 28, 2009, in order for Mayor Kant and Ms. Bishop to settle on the job title and the proposed salary range. Seconded by Councilmember Stankoski, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Eddie Boyett, Director of Recreation, and Liz Chandler, Recreation Center Director, addressed the City Council with a proposal for a special discounted City employee membership rates for the Fairhope Recreation Center and to allow monthly payments for employees opting for an annual membership enrollment. Mayor Kant mentioned this would be an addition to the employee benefits which would need to be amended in the Personnel Manual via ordinance.

Councilmember Mixon moved to approve the 25% employee discount and allow the annual membership to be paid on a monthly basis. Seconded by Councilmember Ford, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Council President Quinn stated that under the Utility Board section she wanted to discuss the separation of the Water & Sewer financial statements. Councilmember Mixon replied that this was already being taken care of and there was no need to vote on this issue.

Councilmember Stankoski moved to appoint Rod Platt to the Fairhope Airport Authority to fill the vacancy of Ken Knutsen, for the balance of the six-year term expiring March 2011 and to reappoint Joe McEnerney for a six-year term expiring March 2015. Seconded by Councilmember Ford, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Jim Horner, Chairman of the Fairhope Environmental Advisory Board, addressed the City Council and explained the STAG Grant, the Special Appropriations Projects Funding Process and the City's request for inclusion on the funding list. Mr. Horner also explained that the City had already sent an informal request to be included on the funding list via e-mail and now the City needs to formally request the same. He said the reason for the grant was to create a GIS based inventory of the City's existing storm water infrastructure which will include detention and retention ponds, inflows and outflows along with the City's storm water conveyance system. Nancy Milford, City Planner, stated that this was a non-construction project for an assessment of regional retention and would cost the City at the most \$202,000. Councilmember Mixon asked if we write the letter are we obligated for this money. Ms. Milford replied no.

Council President Quinn announced Item 8.c.). are minutes from Special Boards and Commissions being presented and reviewed by the City Council:

### c.) Personnel Board

Review minutes from meeting held July 16, 2009 Review minutes from meeting held August 6, 2009

Council President Quinn stated that the Mayor had recommended the appointment of Walt Bolton for the Tree Committee, but wanted to hold off on this appointment to make sure other citizens (Garden Society) were also appointed. Mayor Kant stated he spoke with Tom Ellis about the two other appointments for this committee. After further discussion, Councilmember Ford moved to appoint Walt Bolton to the Tree Committee for a three-year term expiring in September 2012. Seconded by Councilmember Kingrea, motion passed by the following voice votes: AYE – Stankoski, Mixon, Ford, and Kingrea. NAY – Quinn.

Council President mentioned that she was going to review all of the committees' By-Laws with Sherry Sullivan. Mayor Kant replied that Ms. Sullivan would not be doing this review because she is not qualified. He said Gregg Mims will get someone to help you.

Gregg Mims addressed the City Council and commented that preparing a grant takes a great deal of work to compile. He said we do not need to send a letter to be on the funding list if we are not going to accept the grant. Councilmember Mixon said we need to know the matching amounts in order to budget and this item needs to go before the Fairhope Financial Advisory Committee. Ms. Milford said she would get the information for the committee. This item was put on hold until the September 28, 2009 City Council meeting.

Councilmember Mixon introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of the following resolution, a resolution to award the Bid for Chlorine Monitoring System for the Water & Sewer Department (Bid No. 020-09) Seconded by Councilmember Stankoski, motion passed unanimously by voice vote

## RESOLUTION NO. 1555-09

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, as follows:

- [1] That the City of Fairhope did request, receive, and open bids for Chlorine Monitoring System for the Water & Sewer Department (Bid Number 020-09) at 555 South Section Street in the City of Fairhope offices, Fairhope, Alabama.
- [2] At the appointed time and place, the following bids were opened and tabulated as follows:

Please see attached Bid Tabulation for Chlorine Monitoring System for the Water & Sewer Department

[3] After evaluating the bid proposals with the required bid specifications, Aqua Products, Inc., with the total bid proposal of \$29,333.00, is now awarded the bid for Chlorine Monitoring System.

Adopted on this 14th day of September, 2009

imothy M. Kant, Mayor

Attest:

Lisa A Hanks, City Clerk

CITY OF FAIRHOPE BID TABBLATION AND RECOMMENDATION BID NO. 1020 of BID NAME. CHLORINE MONITORING SYSTEM BID OPENED: 69 41-69 5001; BID BINI Waterd

| VENDOR   | Hid<br>Bond  | Manufacturor                         | Model  | Specification Compliance   | Bid Price Per<br>Una    | Quantity   | Hera Tulat Price           | Addenda<br>Signed / Ret                | Grand Total<br>Bid Price                |
|--|--|--------------------------------------|--|----------------------------|-------------------------|--|----------------------------|--|---|
| AQUA PRODUCTS, INC   |  |                                      |  |                            |                         |  |                            |  |   |
| Chlorine Monitors with Chart   | You / CK   |                                      |  | Yes                        | i i                     |  |                            | Yes                                    | \$29,333,00                             |
| Recorders, Installed   |  | ProstingnyHoneywek                   |  |                            |                         |  |                            |  |   |
| Cirionne Monitors with Cruri   |  | Programmenoneywas                    | D:CADFI43D0  |                            | \$4,172.00              | 6  | \$25,032.00                |  |   |
| Recorders, Not Installed   |  | Prominantificherweit                 | 1140 m.g. acc  |                            |                         |  |                            |  |   |
| Charte los   |  | 1.10mmillion outly wes               | D1C/DR4300   |                            | \$4,172.00              | 1  | \$4,172.00                 |  |   |
| Recorder   |  | Honeywell                            | 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5  |                            | 1                       |  |                            |  |   |
| Alternate Bid  |  | i designation                        | 240010014071   |                            |                         | 144  | \$120.00                   | /*                                     |   |
| equipment of the second se | 7  | विक्रियालया चार्याच्या विक्रियालया । |  |                            |                         | *********  | \$26,365.00                |  |   |
| HAGERMEYER NA  | NO BID   | NOBID                                | NO BID   | NO BID                     | NO BID                  |  |                            |  |   |
| Chlorina Monitors with Chert   |  |                                      |  |                            | NO BILL                 |  | NO 850                     | NO BID                                 | NO BID                                  |
| Recorders, Installed   | NO BID   | NO BID                               | NO BID   | NO BID                     |                         |  |                            |  |   |
| Chlorina Moniture with Charl   |  |                                      |  | HO BID                     | NO BID                  |  | NO BID                     | NO BID                                 | NO BID                                  |
| Recorders, Not installed   | NOBID  | NO BID                               | NO BID   | NO BID                     | NOBID                   | 1  | NO BID                     |  | 1                                       |
| Charts for   |  |                                      |  |                            | 39.50                   |  | NOSID                      | NO BID                                 | NO BID                                  |
| Recorder   | NO BID   | NOBID                                | NORID  | NOBID                      | NO BID                  | 144  | NO BID                     | NO BID                                 |   |
| Atlernate Bid  | NO BID   | NO 8(D                               | NO BIO   | NO 810                     | NO BID                  |  | NO BID                     |  | NO BIO                                  |
|  | A STANSON OF THE PARTY OF THE P | Service Control                      | And the state of t | THE PERSON NAMED IN COLUMN |                         | 2 1  | NV OIL                     | NO BID                                 | - NO DID                                |
| J.H. WRIGHT & ASSOCIATES, INC.   | Yes / CK   |                                      |  | Yes                        |                         |  |                            | Yes                                    | *******                                 |
| Chlorine Monitors with Copy  | T  | [                                    |  |                            |                         |  |                            |  | \$50,600,00                             |
| Resouters, installed   |  | Severn Trent                         | Microchern2  | 1                          | \$7,316.00              |  | \$43,890.00                |  |   |
| Chloring Monstons with Charl   |  |                                      |  |                            |                         | *  |                            |  |   |
| Recorders, Not Installed   |  | Severa Trent                         | Edition (Spring)   |                            | \$6,710.00              | 1  | \$6,710.00                 |  |   |
| Charte tor   |  |                                      |  |                            |                         |  | 3200000                    |  |   |
| Regorder   |  | Severa Trent                         | 77-4004  |                            |                         | 144  | \$0.00                     |  | j                                       |
| Affernate Bid  |  |                                      |  |                            |                         |  | \$48,400.00                |  |   |
|  | 20 0000 00000  |                                      | a regular day of the control of  | CONTRACTOR CONTRACTOR      | 4 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 | 11. 12. 12. 12. 13. 13. 14. 15. 14. 15. 14. 15. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14 | the contract of the second |  | ,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,, |
| SOUTHEAST WATER SYSTEMS, LLC   | No.  |                                      |  | Yes                        |                         |  |                            |  | \$20,050.00                             |
| Chlorine Monitors with Chart   |  |                                      |  |                            |                         |  |                            |  |   |
| Recorders, Installed   | ~~~~~  | Hydro Inst                           | RPH-250-2-6-1  |                            | \$3,050.00              |  | \$28,700,60                |  |   |
| Chlorine Monitors with Chart   |  |                                      |  | 1                          |                         |  | 1                          |  | 1-77                                    |
| Recordors, Not Installed   |  | Hydro Inst                           | RPH-250-2-5-1  |                            | \$3,200 00              | 1  | \$3,200.00                 |  |   |
| Charle for   | 1  |                                      |  | 1                          | 1                       |  |                            |  |   |
| Recorder   | -1   | Honsywell                            | 24001661-074   |                            |                         | 144  | \$50.00                    |  |   |
| Aliomate Bid   |  |                                      |  |                            |                         |  | \$22,490.00                |  |   |
| TECHNICAL SPECIALTIES, INC.  | THE PERSON OF TH |                                      |  |                            |                         |  | 7.25.25.20.23.1            |  | ,                                       |
| Chlorine Monitors with Chart   |  | No Response                          | No Response  | No Response                | No Response             |  | No Ansponse                | No (Response                           | No Response                             |
| Resorters, Installed   | 1  | N. B                                 | N. P   |                            |                         | _  |                            | N. D                                   |   |
| Chlorine Mondors with Glord  |  | No Response                          | No Resixinse   | No Response                | No Responso             |  | No Response                | No Response                            | No Rrisponse                            |
| Recorders, Not installed   | <b>{</b>   | No Response                          |  | No Response                | No Response             |  |                            |  |   |
| Charle for   |  | No icesponse                         | No Response  | NO RESOURSE                | IND seastionale         |  | No Response                | No Response                            | No Response                             |
| Lecorder   | 1  | No Response                          | No Carnessa  | Alla Francisca             | No Response             | 144  | No 50000000                | No Response                            | *** ***                                 |
| Mernate Bid  |  | No Resignae                          | No Response  | No Response                | No Response             |  | No Response                | No Response                            | No Response                             |
| 414 1910 1919  |  | THO INTERNATION                      |  | NO CESTICATE               |                         | ~~~~~~~~~~   |                            | Lesponse                               | TOO SHOP CHAR                           |
| CONTROL PRODUCTS   |  | No Response                          | No Response  | No Response                | No Response             |  | No Response                | No Response                            | No Response                             |
| Chicane Monitors with Chart  | -1   |                                      |  |                            |                         |  | 4                          |  | CHENTINGS.                              |
| Recorders, Installed   | 1  | Nu Rasponse                          | No Response  | No Response                | No Response             | 6  | No Response                | No Response                            | No Response                             |
| Moning Monitors with Chart   |  |                                      |  |                            |                         |  | 7.7.15.11900-00199         |  | THE THE BUILDING                        |
| Iscorders, Not Installed   | 1 1  | No Response                          | No Response  | No Rosponse                | No Response             |  | No Response                | No Response                            | No Response                             |
| charts for   | <b></b>  |                                      | - Contract C | 11.7.7.01119.01416         |                         |  | ACCOUNTS AT REPORTS SEED.  | The Compound                           | ini vesbouse                            |
| lecurder   | 1  | No Response                          | No Response  | No Response                | No Response             | 144  | No Response                | No Response                            | No Response                             |
| Stantate Bid   | 1  | No Response                          | No Response  | No Response                | No Response             |  | No Rospense                | No Response                            | No Heavense                             |
|  |  |                                      |  |                            |                         |  |                            | ************************************** | Jan riemonse                            |
| ARL E. JOHNSON, INC.   | ********   | No Response                          | No Response  | No Britigionia             | No Response             |  | No Response                | No Response                            | No Response                             |

| Citorine Monitors with Chart   |                                       |            |   |  |   |                   |                                 |                    |                   |
|--|---------------------------------------|------------|---|--|---|-------------------|---------------------------------|--------------------|-------------------|
| Recorders, Installed   | No Res                                |            |   |  | 1   |                   | 1                               |                    | (·~·              |
| Chlorine Monitors with Chart   | ND REI                                | ponse      | No Response   | No Rezoanse  | No Response                                       | 6                 | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Recorders, Not Installed   |                                       |            |   |  | 1   |                   | 7                               |                    |                   |
| Cherts for   | No Res                                | ponse :    | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 1                 | No Response                     | No Response        | No Acegorisa      |
|  | 1                                     | -          |   |  |   |                   | 1                               | ,                  |                   |
| Recorder   | No Res                                |            | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 144               | No Response                     | No Resconse        | No Response       |
| Aliemaie Bid   | No Res                                | ponte      | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| . April 1986 to the second   | A                                     | 3 35 55    |   |  | 47 11 11 11 11 11 11 11                           |                   | The second second second second | weight research    | (14 1243000185    |
| WATER TREATMENT & CONTROLS CO.   | No Res                                | ganne :    | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       |                   | No Рекрапье                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Chlorine Monitors with Chart   |                                       |            |   | The state of the s |   | ***************** | 1                               | 170.170.000.130    | The Mestakise     |
| Recorders, Installed   | No Res                                | ponse      | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Chloride Monitors with Chart   |                                       |            |   |  | 1 30,114,020,000                                  |                   | . Its . trapping                | True true spanning | по матриине       |
| Recorders, Nat installed   | No Res                                | porise     | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 1                 | No Response                     | No Response        | No December       |
| Charte for   |                                       | £4-12      |   |  | 170 1100 1100                                     | *** ************* | 140 r tuspunsu                  | no nesponsa        | No Response       |
| Recorder   | No Ros                                | more I     | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 144               |                                 |                    |                   |
| Allemate Bid   | No Res                                |            | No Response   | No Resconse  |   |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
|  | 75.5-27.5-37.1 - 186-1707             | - Per      | NO ITERIALIE  | MD LESIXHER  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| C & H SYSTEMS, LLC   | No Res                                | 0.000      | No Response   |  | 222222222   |                   |                                 |                    | 12000 Magney 4    |
| Chlorine Monitors with Clian   | IND NE                                | polise .   | NO KUNJANEO   | No Rasponse  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Recorders, Installed   | No Res                                | }          |   |  | 1 1   |                   |                                 |                    |                   |
| Chlorine Monitors with Charl   | No Kos                                | ponse ]    | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 6                 | No Rosponsa                     | Na Response        | No Response       |
| Recorders, Not Instalted   | 1                                     | - 1        |   |  | i i   |                   |                                 |                    |                   |
|  | No Res                                | gonsn      | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 1                 | No Response                     | No Response        | No Résponse       |
| Charts for   |                                       | 1          |   |  | i   |                   |                                 |                    |                   |
| Regorder   | No Ros                                |            | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 144               | No Response                     | Na Response        | No Response       |
| Allernate Bid  | No Ros                                | ponse      | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | Но Вевропке       |
| 3 0 34 34 3 3 3 3 3  | 980 HW 15289-88                       | 100000     | Parting interest for service energy                 | 1200113 1300120  | 2747271623810                                     |                   |                                 | Section Assessment | 100 minutes       |
| SOUTHERN WATER TECHNOLOGIES, INC.  | No Res                                | ponse      | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Circome Monitors with Chart  |                                       |            |   |  |   |                   | 7                               |                    |                   |
| Recorders, Installed   | No Res                                | ponse [    | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 6                 | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Cilifornia Monitors with Chart   |                                       |            |   | ,  |   |                   |                                 |                    |                   |
| Recorders, Not Installed   | No Res                                | ponse      | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 1                 | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Charts for   |                                       |            |   | manufacture of the state of the |   |                   |                                 |                    | . 102.1.1177.44   |
| Recorder   | No Res                                | ornsa l    | No Roseonse   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 144               | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Alternate Bid  | No Res                                |            | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Resource        | No Response       |
| TO A CONTRACTOR OF THE PARTY OF | - 1.2N C 50 C 50 6 7 6 6 5            | -245.45.47 | 9 8 9 2 9 2 9 0 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 |  | 7 20 39 30 0                                      | 10000             |                                 | 107104010          | . Tell (Capper Sp |
| THERMO FISCHER SCIENTIFIC  | No Res                                | *****      | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | No Response       |
| Chlorine Monitors with Chart   |                                       | P. 148.    | No respunse   | rto respanse   | 150 i teaborae                                    |                   | TED INDSPONSE                   | 140 INCAPORAL      | MO MENTINEE       |
| Recorders, Installed   | No Res                                |            | **. *   |  | No Response                                       | 8                 | No Response                     | No Response        |                   |
|  | NO IXES                               | ponse      | No Response   | No Rosponso  | No Hospanso                                       |                   | ) No Acspanse                   | No Herbourse       | No Response       |
| Chlorine Monitors with Chart   | · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · | - 1        |   |  |   |                   | 1                               |                    |                   |
| Recorders, Not Installed   | No Res                                | pxxxse     | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | Na Response       |
| Charts for   |                                       | ļ          | i   |  |   |                   | 1                               |                    |                   |
| Recardor   | No Res                                |            | No Response   | No Response  | No Response                                       | 144               | No Response                     | No Resixinse       | No Response       |
| Alternate Bid  | No Res                                | ponse      | No Response   | No Response  | No Rosponso                                       |                   | No Response                     | No Response        | No Rosponso       |
|  |                                       |            |   |  | 4 1. C. S. A. |                   |                                 |                    | 4924 (475)        |
|  | (1)                                   |            | 7 Table 14  |  |   |                   |                                 |                    | The State of      |

Recommendation: To accept the bid of Aqua Products, Inc. in the artificial of \$20,333.00
Delta McCrory, Water 4.55 On Superintendent

to the bost of my knowledge this is a true and accurate bid labeledon

Land Common 9,12,109

Daniel P. Arras, Purchasing Hanger

City Council reviewed an application for a Restaurant Liquor License by Xian Chu Ou, Shanghai Cottage at Fairhope, Inc., d/b/a Shanghai Cottage at Fairhope located at 22530 U. S. Highway 98, Suite 250, Fairhope, Alabama. Councilmember Mixon moved to approve the issuance of the license. Seconded by Councilmember Stankoski, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Mayor Kant addressed the City Council requesting to extend the September 30, 2009 deadline for the services of a City employee helping with the office work for the Fairhope-Point Clear Rotary Youth Programs, Inc.'s Youth Facility known as the Boys & Girls Club until after the budget for the year ending September 30, 2010 is approved. Councilmember Kingrea moved to extend the deadline for the services of a City employee helping at the Youth Facility located on Young Street until after the budget for the year ending September 30, 2010 is approved. Seconded by Councilmember Stankoski, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Mayor Kant stated that he had only heard good comments regarding Charles Durgin, the City employee, who is helping at the Youth Facility. He said Mr. Durgin is doing an excellent job.

Charles Durgin addressed the City Council and gave an update on the Youth Facility. Mr. Durgin said they broke records this summer with attendance with 139 kids. The after school program was also higher with 43 kids. He mentioned the Youth Facility needing volunteers and that on September 17, 2009 a fundraiser will be held at the Fairhope Civic Center for this facility.

Councilmember Mixon moved to pay bills as presented. Seconded by Councilmember Ford, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Councilmember Mixon introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of the following resolution, a resolution to award the Bid for Quail Creek Golf Course Food Service (Bid No. 023-09). Seconded by Councilmember Kingrea, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

\*

## RESOLUTION NO. 1556-09

# BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF FAIRHOPE, ALABAMA, as follows:

- [1] That the City of Fairhope did request, receive, and open bids for Quail Creek Golf Course Food Service (Bid Number 023-09) at 555 South Section Street in the City of Fairhope offices, Fairhope, Alabama
- [2] At the appointed time and place, the following bids were opened and tabulated as follows:

## QUAIL CREEK GOLF COURSE FOOD SERVICE

A Taste of New Orleans, Inc.

Alternative Bid 3% Ist year, 5% thereafter

Initial Term: 2 years with 3 possible

1-year extensions

#### NO OTHER RESPONSES WERE RECEIVED

[3] After evaluating the bid proposals with the required bid specifications, A Taste of New Orleans, Inc., based on the alternative bid proposal, is now awarded the bid for Quail Creek Golf Course Food Service

Adopted on this 14th day of September, 2009

Timothy M. Kant, Mayo

Attest:

Lisa A) Hanks, City Clerk

Councilmember Stankoski introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of the following resolution, a resolution authorizing Mayor Timothy M. Kant to execute an agreement with the Alabama Department of Transportation relating to a Transportation Enhancement project (Project No-STPTE-TE09(978) for Greeno Road sidewalks. Seconded by Councilmember Mixon, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

## **RESOLUTION NO. 1557-09**

## **BE IT RESOLVED,** by the City of Fairhope as follows:

- 1. That the City enters into an agreement with the State of Alabama, acting by and through the Alabama Department of Transportation relating to a Transportation Enhancement project with partial funding by the Federal Highway Administration, which agreement is before this Council;
- 2. That the agreement be executed in the name of the City, for and on behalf of the City, by its Mayor-
- 3. That it be attested by the Clerk and the seal of the City affixed thereto-

**BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED**, that upon completion of the execution of the agreement by all parties, that a copy of such agreement be kept on file by the City Council.

DULY ADOPTED THIS 14TH DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2009

Timothy M. Mant, Mayor

ATTEST:

Lisa A. Harks, City Clerk

Debra Green addressed the City Council and gave a brief synopsis of the following document regarding the City Council meetings being recorded:

September 14, 2009 Failthope Cky Council Request for Recontation of Council Minutes Debts Green Page 1 of 2

I spent 17 years as a registered nurse. Council Prosident Quinn was also a nurse in abotter life. Through this experience, we learned, sentellines the hard way, if it is not documented, it did not happen. Perford.

Luse this as an analogy regarding the official recording of the minutes of the Philihope City Council. The meeting rethrales are this permeanent, official record of what has branched during Council needings. As such, they are utilized as official (countertation in a Coun of Law. Captino Mobile, and other government bodies have embraced this technology, which has been around since 167? when Thomas Edina utilized his first recorded with the product of the since 167 and Thomas Edina utilized his first recorded with the size of the product of the this product of the size of

A few weeks age, a motion was made by this council to officially record the mouting minutes. Although I did not attend this particular intenting, it is my understanding the motion died for lack of a second. Retriolistic for same, unknown.

I believe avery detaun of Fairhope would agree, for a multitude of reasons, recording of Council Munico is not a fusury but a proven necessity, especially considering the anission within the minutes of promises made by Mr. Autur Coan during the October 23, 2000 Council monthing.

THIS IS A PRIME EXAMPLE AS TO WHY THEY MUST BE RECORDED.

During the 9/8/00 P&Z Contribsion meeting, according to stinternosts made by his representatives, although promises were made in 2005; however, not accumented, the impression is Mr. Corte is of the opinion in does not have to comply with the more shingent regulations including setbacks vs. buffers, which have been adopted since the initial approval of the Corte PUD.

Had the inveiling been recorded and reviewed, the comments would be on record and he might possibly be required to adhere to his premises. Many of us remember his premises including Jim Homer, Bobby Green, Jackie Wavrunok, mysoff, and many other members of our community.

Further, I cannot folly ou how many limes I have hourd Mayor Krail commonly in didn't make time minutes, but don't you remember... Mayor Krail is corned. Many librar are not included in make time minutes, but don't you remember... Mayor Krail is corned. Many librar are not included in a some many library in the state of the state of the some many library. In the state of the stat

Officially, documented montings will make matters clear, provide exact details and may possibly help the City exolid a listed wave of anyusts. Many, me included, have come before the Council help the City exolid a listed wave of anyusts. Many, me included, have come before the Council relies to the Council relies of the Council relies on that your approach was far from the provided in the Council relies on stort to follow up and Starf, at present, is utilized as the best tool the Council has to implament decisions. Starf, attitudge interior products at their respective delines are furnam, we all make mattakes. Official recordings will serve as a botter tool as it is impossible for each of you to always remember exactly with with approved.

This Council has sought mere transparency with our city Severiment, protocularly with the mayor at the financiar. You have also disrepaid the financiar. You have also disrepaid the piloty of thy unitycons and to whom they inswer with the nepec of protog them more it ease and indisconing without the fear of pushelment or pondity. You want to great longite its select a new Police Child from outside the fold to nesure the low would be equally and lowfully antorood. You have made great strides to implement measures for the betterment of our City Government.

However, with the tack of they second to the motion to record the minutes, and without any intent of disrespect, you have given the impression you are not willing to place this same type of transpirance your journey continues. I am of the bellef you should not the coveragle.

in April 2007. This Myran reported on the Alabamia Open Meetings Act "In it midshell." (A copy of which is attached.) This information covered recording of intenties and behavior expected of elected of felials repaiding a queerin, seed the events and other behaviors, however, dist not outline any information partializing to the Council's ability or authority to record meeting ministes. The only clear statement is "A meating of a governmental body roup to expert any expension in attendance by means of a staps recorder or by other means."

I have contacted the League of Minicipalities reperding this issue; however, eithough tempayer funded, was taid I was unauthorized to receive any information, the League was in place to protocol and provide information to elected orbitals and authorized presonnel, not use public.

With this in mind, it is my hope and sincere request you will reconsider this leave and metions be made to:

- Officially record meeting retirules
   Research and determine the proper mechanism of reporting that can be utilized in a court of tax.
   Investigate and determine how and who will maintain any such recordings and now they will be made available for public review.

Thank you for your thoughtfut and immediate consideration to this most important issue, I also hereby request this decement be made part of the official record and minutes of the Soptember 14, 2000 Council Meeting.

Respectally

Alre Bun

4143

4144

#### 26 April 2007

. City Altorney, Merion E. Wynne reported on the Alabama Open Meeting Act

## ALABAMA OPEN MEETINGS ACT IN A NUISBEAL

It is the policy of the same that the deliberative precess of government and all governments between the same and the cycle to the policy and as exacting that the held without printing solds as required by the Open Montaley and COMA. I Terrorise in communication all these becomes of the communication and the bestwiften of terrorise that policy. The Montaley of Communication and the best of the communication and the communication of the communicat

The OOA Applies to a "revoling" of a governmental body. A meeting is "a possuraged gathering, of a govern of a povernmental body as a time and place which is not by law. A "meeting is the presented publishing of a govern of a governmental body during which prese the body is unbostned by the Ne secretic in povern or to expend publish forch. A "meeding is in the secretic interest which presented or not of a spectrum of a governmental body divide in direct presenting of the present of

All jourcemonal bodies subject to the ONAs shall gost notice of all notelings at forst sown calender days before the mosting. A city consoil shall post anotes of sail averting rea is builden board at a place commented in the public in the cale plant. The consoil shall be notedly war precise of the public or the serva world who has to spiciously only the Test consoil shall be notedly war procedured or public or the serva world who has to spiciously or with the public or the serva world who has to spiciously only to report the public or the serva world who has to spiciously only the public or the public or the serva serva of the public way. concred at the meeting. A specific of a governmental body may be expently recorded by any person in anticharch by towns of a tape recorder or by other means.

An executive resident is a portion of a meeting of a governmental body from which the public is entirely for one function of the course prescribed in the OSA. The afforded tensor for an "executive series" in: ((1) to Secure for general registeries on determent, hypothetical confider, professional competence, or mattel builds of individual or to distract the jobs performance of certain professional congestions, or mustal builds of historiates or to discuss the job performance of corrise persons. This reason is adjusted control historiates, (1) to discuss a cle consider discipling or thinking of a public employers when expressly allowed by lickased or rate into, (1) To discuss persons would discluse the kinding of an acclement law enforcement agent or to discuss whether or not to list external complish, (1) To discuss somewhich though in white to pay to persons exact white or not to list external complish, (1) To discuss somewhich though in white to pay to persons the case whether or not to list personnectably by the job persons, (1) To discuss natural extensive the pays to persons receive when the personnectably will be composing in the standar place who there compares no experimental lodes, (3) To discus strengt processing for appositions between the porters and body and a grown of public registryst. (3) To discuss arisings are relationed presented when the governmental body is acting in a quasi-fundabilit agreeity.

#### 26 April 2007

Recently the Alabama Antonry General decided note to present the Askerin City Council for violating the CMA because a speares of council methors cert or grident decides of a formal servicing to diseast the artist. The everypair at page is as a pair, DMP distanced that the editoring general missed for print. It are expair as a possible profession of the faw through additional missed for print. It are expair as a possible and participated as a participate when the profession which the council missed so that a decide on what a quiciliant of the possible rich before the formal secting council of the council mention in children and participate the profession and one day to the and applicable profession for the state of the council mention. The depolits Assistant of the decides are also selected to the profession of the profession and the prof

The prevapages a position is that the decision should not be based on whether or not a quorum This is prompting to the control of the control of

However, since the goal is to promote transparency in government operations and evoid the appearance of imagingspirius decision realizing our of public view, it is reasonable to avoid entirity like that practiced by the Authorn Chy Council.

Tut Wyzze City Attamey April 24, 2867

. Mr. Joel Harnel with U. S. EPA Region 4 presented the following PowerPoint min. were manner with U.S., etch recigion a precedent for forwing convertions of Pretentiation to explain a research study that EPA will conduct at the CIV of Fairings beach. The interviews for the study will start May 19, 2007 through Labor Day weekerd, at 10/09 a.m., The study will be conclusted on weekerds only except for the d<sup>20</sup> of July.

Joe Birindelli addressed the City Council and announced that the Honor Flight for the World War II veterans would be this Wednesday. He invited everyone to the Mobile Regional Airport to greet the veterans when the Honor Flight returns Wednesday evening.

Mayor Kant addressed the City Council and gave an update on the sidewalk on Young Street for the Fairhope-Point Clear Rotary Youth Club and said he asked David Ed Bishop about giving an estimate on what it would cost to extend the sidewalk. Mayor Kant said he would bring back to the City Council once he has the estimate and ask for their help.

Council President Quinn entered the following memorandum to go into an Executive Session for approximately <u>30</u> minutes:



September 14, 2009

Timothy M. Kant, A.C.M.O.

Lisa A. Hanks - City Ckrk

Nancy K. Wilson, CPA City Pressure

Compell Members

Michael A. Ford, A.C.M.O.

Lonnic L. Mixon Druble W Quinn, A.C.M.O. Daniel R. Stankoski, C.M.O. Council President Quinn City Councilmembers

As City Attorney Marion E. Wynne, I hereby request the Fairhope City Council go into executive session based on Section 36-25A-7(a)(3) to hear an update of all the legal issues (current and pending).

City Attorney Wynne does hereby declare that the City Council of the City of Fairhope rise from a Regular City Council meeting, on Monday, September 14, 2009, to go into Executive Session.

The City Council shall be in Executive Session for approximately 30 menutes minutes/hour(s). At the end of the Executive Session the City Council shall return to the City Council Chambers to resume the Regular City Council meeting.

The time is  $\frac{7:25}{\text{City Council exits the dais to go into Executive Session.}}$ 

Debbie Quinn, City Council President

Marion E. Wynne City Attorney

161 North Section Street

PO. Drawer 129

Fairhope, Alabama 36533

251-928-2135

251-928-6776 Fax

www.colairhope.com

Councilmember Mixon moved to go into Executive Session. Seconded by Councilmember Stankoski, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

Exited the dais at 7:25 p.m. Returned at 7:51 p.m.

Councilmember Mixon moved to adjourn the meeting. Seconded by Councilmember Ford, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

There being no further business to come before the City Council, the meeting was duly adjourned at 7:52 p.m.

Debbie W. Quinn, Council President

Lisa A. Hanks, City Clerk