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3 April 2009

NOTICE AND CALL QF SPECIAL MEETING

Notice is hereby given of a special meeting of the City Council of the City
of Fairhope, Alabama, to be held at the Fairhope Municipal Complex on Friday, 3
April 2009, at §:00 a.m., for the purpose to!

1. Emergency Bid for Electric Depariment

Debé;fe‘\gl»/,‘ Quinfl: Council President

The undersigned members of the City Council of the City of Fairhope,

CONSENT 70 HOLDING OF MEETING

Alabamia, do hereby acknowledge service of the Notice and Call of Special
Meeting hereinabout set forth and do hereby consent to the holding of such

meeling as such time in such place for the purpoese set forth therein.

o L _

DGl

Attest:

= i

Lisa A.}Iamﬁs,’(}i‘[y ek


Lisa
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STATE OF ALABAMA )
COUNTY OF BALDWIN 3(
The City Council, City of Fairhope, met in Special Session at
8:00 a.m., Fairhope Municipal Complex Conference Room,

161 North Section Street, Fairhope, Alabama 36532, on
Friday, April 3, 2009.

Present were Council President Debbie W. Quinn, Councilmembers: Daniel
Stankoski, Lonnie L. Mixon, Michael A. Ford, and City Clerk Lisa A. Hanks.
Councilmember Rick Kingrea, Mayor Timothy M. Kant, and City Attorney Marion
E. Wynne were absent.

There being a quorum present, Council President Quinn called the meeting to
order.

Scott Sligh, Electric Department Supervisor, briefly explained the Bids and
RFQ received and then recommended the City Council to rescind all bids for Bid
Number 008-09, Bid Number 009-09, and Bid Number 010-009; and to accept the
RFQ Number 001-09 presented before them.

Councilmember Mixon introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption of
the following resolution, a resolution to rescind all bids for emergency bids for a
Substation Transformer (Bid Number 008-09), Outdoor Vacuum Circuit Breakers
(Bid Number 009-09), and Voltage Regulators (Bid Number 010-09). Seconded by
Councilmember Stankoski, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

RESOLUTION NO. 1499-09

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF FAIRHOPE,
ALABAMA, as follows:

[1] That the City of Fairhope did request, receive, and open emergency bids for a Substation
Transformer {Bid Number 008-09), Outdoor Vacuum Circuit Breakers (Bid Number 009-09),
and Voltage Regulators (Bid Number 010-09), at 555 South Section Street in the City of
Fairhope offices, Fairhope, Alabama.

{2] At the appointed time and place, the following bids were opened and tabulated as follows:

SUBSTATION TRANSFORMER (Bid Number 008-09)

Graybar No Bid
Siemens Energy, Inc. $ 457,673.00
Howard Industries 326,575.00

Mayer Electric 348,000.00



4978

3 April 2009

HD Supply Utilities 377,765.00
Southcon 258,000.00
Irby 341,850.00
Pauwels Transformers, Inc. 342,865.00
Waukesha Electric Systems Improper Bid
WEG Electric Motors Corp 358,240.00

[3] After evaluating the bid proposal with the bid specifications, and going out on a RFQ for
a refurbished substation transformer, all bids on Bid No. 008-09 are rescinded for the
substation transformer,

OUTDOOR VACUUM CIRCUIT BREAKERS (Bid Number 009-09)

Graybar $41,837.30
Siemens Energy, Inc. 4(,882.00
Areva T & D, Inc. 45,600.00
Southcon 49,500.00
Stuart C. Irby Co. 39,040.00
Gresco, Inc. Utility Improper Bid

[3] After evaluating the bid proposal with the bid specifications, and going out on a RFQ for
a refurbished substation transformer, all bids on Bid No. 009-09 are rescinded for outdoor
circuit breakers.

VOLTAGE REGULATORS (Bid Number 010-09)

Graybar No Bid

Siemens Energy, Inc. $97,710.00
Howard Industries 60,450.00
Gresco Utility Supply 97,831.38
HD Supply Utilities 97,831.38

[3] After evaluating the bid proposal with the bid specifications, and going out on a RFQ for
a refurbished substation transformer, all bids on Bid No. 008-09 are rescinded for voltage
regulators.

Adopted on this 3rd day of April, 2009

At/
e M
Timothy M. ant,Nayor

Attest:

e e ;
73

“Xiea A, }{anks, City Clerk
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CiTY OF FAIRHOFPE

HID TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION REVISED 04.01.08

B8iD NO. : 008-09

BID NAME: EMERGENCY BID FOR SUBSTATION TRANSFORMER

81D OPENED: 03-28-06
‘Neto: Bid Bong Walved

4979

Dolivery lead Manulacturer Mode! Spacificalon Comptiance | #id Prica Per Addenda
VENDOR tima ARO I Unit | Signed/Ret.
[GRAYRAR NG B0 EED NO BID NO BID NG BID NOBID
SIEMENS ENERGY, INC. 203 days Slemens S.A. CKOURAS YES § 457 B73.00 YES
HOWARD INDUSTRIES 28 waeks Howard Medium Power. NQ $ 326,5";‘5.00 HINOHIND
MAYER ELECTRIC 175 days Prolec Blank VES $_245,000.00 | HINGAVES
HD SUPPLY UTILITIES 322 days Niagra Trans, Blank NO § Ar7Te500(  YES |
SOUTHCON 84 days Virginla Trang, 1500016800/20000/2 2460125000/28000 YES §_2568,000.00 YES |
IRBY 10-20 waoks ABB NIA YES .341,850.00 | #1INOM2YES |
PAUWELS TRANSFORMERS, INC. | 245 DAYS | Pauwds, Transfornor Blank NO § 34206800 | MINOMEZNG
WAUKESHA ELECTRIC SYSTEMS WMPROPER BID Bid Propossl page missing IMPROPER BID
WEG ELECTRIC MOTORE CORP 156 days WEG 162025438DETC YES § 35822000 YES
Recommendation: RESCIND BIG NQ, 00508 Ta lhe bast of my knowledge Lhis is a kua and accurale bid tabulation
e
< - ol o & .
A_.’ & .‘M Daniel P. Amas, Purchasing Managar
Scoll Sligh, P.E., Eleclic Juperintandent
CITY GF FAIRHOPE
BID TASULATION AND RECOMMENDATION
BID NO. : 009-09
8i0 NAME: EMERGENCY BIZ FOR OUTDOOR VACUUM BREAKER
BiD OPENED; 03-26-09
Nale: BId BONUWEIVEG. et e e e e e
Instructions
Belivery lead Manufaciurar Modal iSpeciicalion Rid Price Par Tolat Bld For
VENDOR time ARQ S Complienca Unil 3 Units
}Gmybar 758 days Squera 0 FURT121120A YeS TS [ 31,687.30
Slemons Enorgy, Inc. b4 days Slumens SPVE-151.5-20.1200 YES $_ 20,447.00 | § 40,882.60
Areva T & B, Inc. 98days_ Ameva 1 & D, inc, 4 EOX-15 WO § 22800001 % 45,600,080
Soulhcon 05-112 days Milsublsl i 170Y-25-12 VES ¥ B4 78000 8 49,500.00
Sluart C. Iy Co. 74 waeks ABB R-mnf [ls] $. 1952600 18 49,040.00 |
Gresco, Ine. Utilily 4 wocks Satin American did not ﬁl'i,g"ul bld propesal NG impropar bid

Rocommendation: RESCIND BID NG, 00308

Scott Sligh, P.E., Elgel

Superintendent

A ide.20]

Ta Ihs best of my knowlsdge s i3 a lrve and accurate bid labulation

LI FHL R

€ 2

Danlel £, Ames, Purchasing Manager
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CITY OF FAIRHOPE

BiD TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION

BID NO. : 010-08

BiD NAME: EMERGENCY BID FOR VOLTAGE REGULATORS

Bil OPENED; 03-26-09
Note: Bld Bond Walved
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Delivery load Manulaclurar Model SpecHicaton Compliance | Bid Price Per | Total Bid Far 3
VENDOR lime ARC Unit Linkts
GRAYBAR NC BID
SIEMENS ENERGY, INC. 56 days Enargy 11-07.6-889.0 YES $ 2257000 f % 97,710.00
HOWARD INDUSTRIES 26-30 weeks Howard Regulator NO § 2215000} § 66,450.00
GRESCO UTILITY SUPPLY 60 days Cooper Blank NO $ 3261048 | § 9783138
56 days Ceopsr Blank NO $ az2ei0de | $  S7831.38

Wﬁn SUPPLY UTILITIES

{

Rocommendation; Rescind bid no, 01009

Seall Sligh, P.E., Elg

J'tJJL[Z_@?

Ta the best of my knowledge this is a rus and accurala bid tabulation

)‘44...(

Danle! P. Amas, Purchasing Managor

g 1o

Councilmember Stankoski introduced in writing, and moved for the adoption
of the following resolution, a resolution to awarding the RFQ/Quote to Substation
Service Company. Seconded by Councilmember Ford, motion passed unanimously

by voice vote.
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RESOLUTION NO. 1500-09

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF FAIRHOPE,
ALABAMA, as follows:

[1] That the City of Fairhope did request and receive emergency RFQs for a Refurbished
Substation Transformer (RFQ Number 001-09) at 555 South Section Street in the City of
Fairhope offices, Fairhope, Alabama.

{2] At the appointed time and place, the following RFQs were received and tabulated as
follows:

REFURBISHED SUBSTATION TRANSFORMER (RFQ Number 001-09)

Florida Transformer No Bid

Mountain West Transformer No Bid

Power Asset Recovery Corp § 236,000.00 Option 1
Power Asset Recovery Corp 219,500.00 Option 2
Substation Service Company 135,500.00

[3] After evaluating the RFQ proposal with the required specifications, Substation Service
Company, with the total RFQ proposal of $135,500.00, is now awarded the RFQ/Quote for
the refurbished subsiation transformer.

Adopted on this 3rd day of April, 2009

.
ey N

'Fimgtl»{y M. Kant, ]V;tfyor

Adttest:

~Tisa A. ,‘Hgmkfs, City Clerk
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CITY OF FAIRHOPE

RFQ TARULATION and RECOMMENDATION

RFQNO. ; 006-08

RFQ NAME: REFURBISHED SUBSTATION TRANSFORMER
BiD OPENED: 04-01-09

VENDOR DPesvery lons
e AR3D 2o M2
ekt
Brand idodat Tolal Deliversd Price

Florida Transformer afa NG BID NO BID NO BID
Mountain West Transfarmer Wa MO BIO _Nosi HO BID
Power Assot Recovery Corp comply Does Mot Comply With Specs Cpfioni 3 236,000.00,
Powar Asset Recovary Corp noncompliant QplionZ [} 214,500.00
Substation Service Company comply US Transformer { Wostink Statlon 1 135,500.00
Recommendation: Award bid to Substation Service Company Yo the hest ol my knowledge Ihls is a true and accurate abulalion
for thalr hid of $135,500.00 g g
%@ &f”,ﬂ/ ol 7 yr janf

S{U___Wf Danlei P. Ames, Purchasing Manager

L -
Scolt Stigh, P.Ef.._éectrlc Suparintendent

Councilmember Ford moved to adjourn the meeting.  Seconded by
Councilmember Stankoski, motion passed unanimously by voice vote.

There being no further business to come before the City Council, the meeting
was duly adjourned at 8:05 a.m.

Deb\bleW Qumn Counml President

o ﬁsba\ . Hanks, City Clerk



