CITY OF FAIRHOPE

BID TABULATION and RECOMMENDATION

8I0 NUMBER: 008-16

BID NAME: Employee Uniforms
QPENED: January 25, 2016, 9:00 am.
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VENDOR 202 % 1881 & a i ik s s @ S G o 5 =5 SE =3
ARAMARK ***
Yes 18-21 | NO | Yes Gas, Water, Sewer Electric Dept
Manufacturer Carhartt CodeNewport Carhartt Blue Generation Sanmar Carhartt
Manutacturer's ltem No. B324ARG 101554-253 101555-253 1447US7 KAK [FRB159-MOS BG 8213 BG-8213S ST657 ST650 LSTES0 B151-NVY
SUBSTITUTIONS Aramark 5120 Aramark 5025 Aramark 101 Aramark 102 Aramark 11132 Aramark 11115 Dickies 29252
Category 1 Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.93 $29.89 $12.99 $11.99 {No Bid 13.99 13.99 $19.99
Category 2 Unit Price No Bid No Bid No 8id $37.99 $36.98 $14.99 $13.99 INo Bid 15.99] 15,99 $19.99
Category 3 Unil Price No Bid No Bid No Bid §37.99 $36.89 $16.69 $15.89 [No Bid 16.99 $21.99
Alteration charge
SUBTOTALS $106.97 $103.97 $44.97 $41.97 46.97 $29.98 $61.97
WORK U S . . N . P
AT WORK UNIFORM Yes 14 No | Yes Gas, Water, Sewer Electric Dept Public Wks, Recreation, Adult Recreation, {T, Golf, Meter Dept and Building Dept
Manufacturer Carhartt CodeNewport Carhartt Blue Generation Sanmar Carhartt
Manufacturer's item No. BI24ARG 101554-253 101555-253 1117087 KAK [FRB153-MOS BG 8213 BG-82135 ST657 ST650 LST650 B151-NVY
SUBSTITUTIONS
Category 1 Unit Price $31.05 $39.65 $35.35 $72.10 $73.25 $21.05 $21.05 $23.80 $21.05 $21.05 $35.35
Category 2 Unit Price $31.05 $39.65 $35.35 $85.45 $76.80 $22.50 $22.50 $25.35 $22.50 $22.50 $35.35
Category 3 Unit Price not available 542.15 $37.85 not availabie not available $24.05 $24.05 $28.20 $26.75 $26.75 $35.35
Alteration charge $2.50 $2.50
SUBTOTALS $62.10 $121.45 $108.55 $157.55 $150.05 # $67.60 $67.60 $77.45 $70.30 $70.30 $106.05
CINTAS . . .
Yes  [7-10 NO | Yes Gas, Water, Sewer Electric Dept Public Wks, Recreation, Adult Recreation, IT, Golf, Meter Dept and Building Dept
Manufacturer Carhartt CodeNewport Carhartt Biue Generatlon l Sanmar Carhartt
Manufacturer’s ltem No. B324ARG 101554-253 101555-253 1117US7 KAK |FRB159-MOS BG 8213 BG-82138 [ ST657 §T650 LST650 B151-NVY
SUBSTITUTIONS Carhartt light wt Core 385 61581 Core365 61582 BISO-NVY
Category 1 Unit Price $30.00 $37.14 $32.86 $57.95 $68.57 ¥ $18.55 $18.55 $20.85 $13.00 $13.00 $34.57
Category 2 Unit Price $30.00 $37.14 $32.86 $59.95 $68.57 $19.98 $19.98 $22.25 $14.00 $14.00 $34.57
Category 3 Unit Price $30.00 $39.64 $35.36 $60.50 §75 71 $24.27 $24.27 $26.40 $14.50 $14.50 $34.57
Alteration charge
SUBTOTALS $90.00 $112.92 $101.08 $178.40 $212.85 $62.80 $62.80 $69.50 $41.50 $41.50 $103.71
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RIVERBEND ENTERPRISES,

INC Yes 21 Yes Gas, Water, Sewer Electric Dept Public Wks, Recreation, Adult Recreation, IT, Golf, Meter Dept and Building Dept
Manufacturer Carhartt CodeNewpart | Carhartt Blue Generation Sanmar Carhartt
Manufacturer's item Na. B324ARG 101554-253 101555-253 1117US7 KAK [FRB159-MOS BG 8213 BG-82138 ST6S57 ST650 LST650 8151-NVY
SUBSTITUTIONS
Category 1 Unit Price $32.15 $39.90 $36.85 $61.50 $67.75 $19.99 $19.99 $20.99 $18.99 $18.99 $35.75
Category 2 Unit Price $32.15 $41.90 $38.85 $69.90 $67.75 $21.99 $21.99 $22.99 $20.99 $20.99 $34.75
Category 3 Unit Price not available $41.90 $38.85 $69.96 $73.75 $23.99 $23.99 $24.99 $22.99 $22.99 $35.75
Alteration charge not available not available

SUBTOTALS $64.30 $123.70 $114.55 $201.30 $209.25 # $65.97 $65.97 568.97 $62.97 $62.97 $106.25

all sizes up to 48

[ZOGABYS UNTFORNMS
UNLIMITED*™ No No | Yes Gas, Water, Sewer Electric Dept Public Wks, Recreation, Adult Recreation, IT, Golf, Meter Dept and Building Dept
Manufacturer Carhartt CodeNewport Carhartt Blue Generation Sanmar Carhartt
Manufacturer's ltem No. B324ARG 101554-253 | 101555-253 1117US7 KAK |FRB153-MOS BG 8213 8G-82138 ST6S57 5T650 LST650 B151-NVY
SUBSTITUTIONS
Category 1 Unit Price $18.00 $18.00 $21.00 $18.00 $18.00 NA
Category 2 Unit Price $21.50 521.50 $23.00 $21.50, $21.50] NA
Category 3 Unit Price $24.50 $24.50 $26.00 $24.50 524.50 NA
Alteration charge

SUBTOTALS $64.00 $64.00 $70.00 $64.00 $64.00
G&K Services No Response |[No Response |[No Response No Response [No Response No Response [No Response [No Response {No Response [No Response [No Response
Cornerstone Detention Products No Response |No Response |No Response No Response |No Response No Response |No Response |No Response |No Response |No Response |No Response
ASHWORTH, INC I No Response |No Response |No Response No Response |No Response No Response [No Response |No Response |No Response |No Response |No Response
JIM PROMOTIONS & UNIFORMS No Response |No Response {No Response No Response {No Response No Response |No Response |No Response [No Response |No Response |No Response
LAWMEN'S & SHOOTERS SUPPLY No Response [No Response |No Response No Response |No Response No Response |No Response [No Response |No Response |No Response |No Response
SAFETY SOLUTIONS [ No Response |No Response |No Response No Response |No Response No Response |No Response |No Response [No Response |[No Response |No Response
TERRY'S UNIFORMS & SCREEN PRINTING No Response |No Response |No Response No Response |No Response No Response  [No Response |No Response [No Response |No Response |No Response
LEO'S UNIFORMS | No Response |No Response |{No Response No Response |No Response No Response |No Response |No Response [No Response |No Response |No Response
EMBLEM ENTERPRISES, INC No Response [No Response |No Response No Response |No Response No Response |No Response |No Response |No Response [No Response [No Response
UNIFIRST CORP ! No Response {No Response [No Response No Response |No Response No Response {No Response No Response |No Response No Response |No Response

**City calculated totals for ALL BIDS (and are minus alteration costs).
“**Cintas, Aramark and Zoghby's UnHorms had non-responsive bids.
Recommendation: Award Bid to Riverbend Enterprises, Inc. in the amounts ag listed above

To my know| ’dfggthl is an accurate bid (abu\avgr
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Danie! P Ames, Purchasing Manager






